
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 

April 7, 2015 
Sandy City Hall Room 201 

10000 Centennial Pkwy Sandy, UT 

STAFF: 
Dan Jones, Bureau Manager 
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary 

MINUTES 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
William Hall Chris Jensen 
Tracy Ence Kenny Nichols (excused) 
Scott Marsell Gary Payne 
Jerry Jensen James Sullivan 

UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 
Paul Bauer (excused) 
Thomas Peterson (excused) 
Jeff Darr 
Scott Adams (excused) 
Casey Vorwaller 

VISITORS: 
Jim McClintic, Sandy City 

SWEAR IN NEW MEMBER 

MINUTES 

REVIEW SECTION (F) 903.2.8 

Brad Larson 
Deanne Mousley (excused) 
Andrew Baxter (excused) 
Dave Vickers 

Dan Jones administered the oath of office to Tracy 
Ence, the new member for the Architectural Advi
sory Committee. 

A motion was made by William Hall to approve the 
minutes for the February 3rd and March 3rd, 2015 
meetings. The motion was seconded by Jerry Jen
sen and passed unanimously. 

Approval of the Unified Code Analysis Council 
minutes was tabled until the next meeting as there 
was not a quorum present. 

The recommendation for this section was tabled 
until the next meeting. 



Page 2 of 3 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
April 7, 2015 

COMPLETE REVIEW OF CHAPTER 9 OF 
THE 2015 IBC AND CURRENT 
AMENDMENTS 

REVIEW CHAPTERS 10 THROUGH 15 

START REVIEW OF THE 2015 IRC AND 
CURRENT AMENDMENTS 

2 

Jim McClintic spoke to the committees in connec
tion with a change that has been made to the 2015 
IBC for Incidental Uses Specific to Ambulatory 
Care Facilities. Following a discuss, it was decided 
to review this at the next meeting. William Hall 
will do some research for the next meeting. 

Gary Payne joined the meeting at this point. 

The recommendation for amendments to Section 
905 .3.9 and Section 905.8 was tabled until the next 
meeting. 

The committees reviewed the current amendment 
for Section 1028.12. The section number needs to 
be renumbered to 1029.14. Following the discus
sion, a motion was made by William Hall to keep 
the current amendment as modified. The motion 
was seconded by Chris Jensen and passed unani
mously. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment to Section 1109.8 and modify 
the word "lift" to "lifts". The motion was seconded 
by William Hall and passed unanimously. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment to Section 1208.4. The motion 
was seconded by Chris Jensen and passed unani
mously. 

A recommendation for the amendments to Chapter 
15 was tabled until the next meeting. 

James Sullivan gave his review of Chapter 29. A 
motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment to Section (P) Table 2902.1 
and approve the chapter as modified unless the 
Plumbing Advisory Committee has other recom
mendations. The motion was seconded by Tracy 
Ence and passed unanimously. 

Chapters 1-5 of the IRC will be reviewed at the 
next meeting. 



Page 3 of3 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
April 7, 2015 

The meeting adjourned at 10:25. 

Note: These minutes are not intended to be a verbatim transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business conducted in 
this meeting. Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred. 

3 



UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION 
ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
MINTUES 

Scott Marsell, Chairman 

Dan S Jones, Bureau Manager 

Date 

Date 



AGENDA 

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION 
ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 

UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 
MEETING 

May 5, 2015 9:00 AM 
Sandy City Hall Room 341 

10000 Centennial Pkwy, Sandy, UT 
This agenda is subject to change up to 24 hours prior to the meeting. 

Sign attendance sheet 

1. Approve minutes from the February 3, 2015 and March 3, 2015 joint meeting for the 
Unified Code Analysis Council and minutes from the April 7, 2015 meeting 

2. Review Section (F)903.2.8 
3. Review Section 905.3.9 and Section 905.8 
4. Complete review of Chapter 9 of the 2015 IBC and current amendments 
5. Review Table 509 Incidental Uses Specific to Ambulatory Care Facilities 
6. Review Chapter 15 
7. Review Chapters 1-5 of the 2015 IRC and current amendments 

INFO ITEMS 
a. IBC Amendment Status Log 
b. IRC Amendment Status Log 
c. IEBC Amendment Status Log 

Next Scheduled Meeting: June 2, 2015 

If you do not plan on attending this meeting, please call Sharon at 530-6163 or email at ssmalley@utah.gov 
or dansjones@utah.gov. 

(~lo <ompli>"" w;th th• Am.,km w;th o;,.bn;t;., Ad, ;•dMd"''' ""d;•g •p«fal mommod•t;o"' 
(including auxiliary communicative aids and services) during this meeting should notify Dave Taylor, ADA 
Coordinator, at least three working days prior to the meeting. Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing, 
160 East 300 South, Salt Lake City UT 84115, Phone 530-6628 or toll-free in Utah only 866-275-3675. 



UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 

April 7, 2015 
Sandy City Hall Room 201 

10000 Centennial Pkwy Sandy, UT 

STAFF: 
Dan Jones, Bureau Manager 
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary 

MINUTES 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
William Hall 
Tracy Ence 
Scott Marsell 
Jerry Jensen 

UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 
Paul Bauer (excused) 
Thomas Peterson (excused) 
Jeff Darr 
Scott Adams (excused) 
Casey Vorwaller 

VISITORS: 
Jim McClintic, Sandy City 

SWEAR IN NEW MEMBER 

MINUTES 

REVIEW SECTION (F) 903.2.8 

Chris Jensen 
Kenny Nichols (excused) 
Gary Payne 
James Sullivan 

Brad Larson 
Deanne Mousley (excused) 
Andrew Baxter (excused) 
Dave Vickers 

Dan Jones administered the oath of office to Tracy 
Ence, the new member for the Architectural Advi
sory Committee. 

A motion was made by William Hall to approve the 
minutes for the February 3rd and March 3rd, 2015 
meetings. The motion was seconded by Jerry Jen
sen and passed unanimously. 

Approval of the Unified Code Analysis Council 
minutes was tabled until the next meeting as there 
was not a quorum present. 

The recommendation for this section was tabled 
until the next meeting. 



Page 2 of3 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
April 7, 2015 

Jim McClintic spoke to the committees in connec
tion with a change that has been made to the 2015 
IBC for Incidental Uses Specific to Ambulatory 
Care Facilities. Following a discuss, it was decided 
to review this at the next meeting. William Hall 
will do some research for the next meeting. 

Gary Payne joined the meeting at this point. 

COMPLETE REVIEW OF CHAPTER 9 OF The recommendation for amendments to Section 
THE 2015 IBC AND CURRENT 905.3.9 and Section 905.8 was tabled until the next 
AMENDMENTS meeting. 

REVIEW CHAPTERS 10 THROUGH 15 

START REVIEW OF THE 2015 IRC AND 
CURRENT AMENDMENTS 

2 

The committees reviewed the current amendment 
for Section 1028.12. The section number needs to 
be renumbered to 1029 .14. Following the discus
sion, a motion was made by William Hall to keep 
the current amendment as modified. The motion 
was seconded by Chris Jensen and passed unani
mously. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment to Section 1109.8 and modify 
the word "lift" to "lifts". The motion was seconded 
by William Hall and passed unanimously. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment to Section 1208.4. The motion 
was seconded by Chris Jensen and passed unani
mously. 

A recommendation for the amendments to Chapter 
15 was tabled until the next meeting. 

James Sullivan gave his review of Chapter 29. A 
motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment to Section (P) Table 2902.1 
and approve the chapter as modified unless the 
Plumbing Advisory Committee has other recom
mendations. The motion was seconded by Tracy 
Ence and passed unanimously. 

Chapters 1-5 of the IRC will be reviewed at the 
next meeting. 



Page 3 of 3 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
April 7, 2015 

The meeting adjourned at 10:25. 

Note: These minutes are not intended to be a verbatim transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business conducted in 
this meeting. Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred. 

3 



UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 

February 3, 2015 
Sandy City Hall Room 341 

10000 Centennial Pkwy Sandy, UT 

STAFF: 
Dan Jones, Bureau Manager 
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary 

MINUTES 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
William Hall Chris Jensen 
Tracy Ence (excused) Kenny Nichols 
Scott Marsell (excused) Gary Payne 
Jerry Jensen James Sullivan 

UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 
Paul Bauer 
Thomas Peterson 
Jeff Darr 
Scott Adams 
Casey Vorwaller 

VISITORS: 
Wendy Johnson, Midway City 
Kevin Emerson, Utah Clean Energy 
Clint Neering, Wasatch County Fire 

SWEAR IN NEW MEMBER 

MINUTES 

Jam es Williams 
Brad Larson 
Deanne Mousley 
Andrew Baxter (excused) 
Dave Vickers 

Jim McClintic, Sandy City 
Eric Miller, Farmington City 
Ernie Giles, Wasatch County Fire 

Brad Larson was sworn in as the new member for 
the Unified Code Analysis Council. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to approve 
the minutes from the November 4, 2014 joint meet
ing as written. The motion was seconded by Kenny 
Nichols and passed unanimously. 

REVIEW PROPOSED AMENDMENT TO 
SECTION (F)908.7 

Deanne Mousley gave an overview of the proposal 
that Scott Marsell drafted for this section of the 
IBC and IFC. Following the review and discussion 
on the proposal, a motion was made by Tom Peter
son to approve the proposal as presented . The mo
tion was seconded by Gary Payne. During discus-



Page 2 of 4 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
February 3, 2015 

REVIEW PROPOSAL FOR WASATCH 
COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT 

sion on the motion, it was pointed out that the sec
tion number needed to be changed to 915. The first 
and seconded agreed with the modification and the 
motion passed unanimously. 

Clint Neering spoke to the committees in connec
tion with the proposal for a local amendment for 
Wasatch County Fire District. During the discus
sion on the proposal, Jeff Darr pointed out several 
changes that might need to made in order to clarify 
the proposal. A motion was made by Chris Jensen 
to table the recommendation until the next meeting. 
The motion was seconded by Kenny Nichols and 
passed unanimously. Scott Adams and Jeff Darr 
will meet with Wasatch County Fire District to 
make the changes for review at the next meeting. 

COMPLETE REVIEW OF CHAPTER 9 OF Those present reviewed the remainder of Chapter 9 
THE 2015 IBC AND CURRENT and the following recommendations were made. 
AMENDMENTS 

REVIEW CHAPTERS 10 TO 14 

2 

Deanne Mousley, Jeff Darr, and Brad Larson will 
review Section (F) 903.2.8 and report back at the 
next meeting. 

A motion was made by Deanne Mousey to modify 
the current amendment for Section (F)907 .2.3 by 
keeping the amendment, modify (a) and deleting 
(b). The motion was seconded by Chris Jensen and 
passed unanimously. 

A motion was made by Tom Peterson to delete the 
current amendments for Section 908.7, numbers 10, 
11, and 12, and replace them with the new amend
ment for Section 915 that was previously approved. 
The motion was seconded by Chris Jensen and 
passed unanimously. 

The final recommendation for Chapter 9 will be 
made after the State Fire Marshal's Office has had a 
chance to complete their review. 

The following recommendations were made during 
the review of Chapter I 0. 



Page 3 of 4 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
February 3, 2015 

3 

A motion was made by Brad Larson to modify the 
current amendment for Section 1008.1.9 .6 by 
changing the section number 1010.1.9 .6, deleting 
the words from "the words" up to the words "a 
new", and changing the number 8 to 9. The motion 
was seconded by Jeff Darr and passed unani
mously. 

A recommendation for Section 1008.1.9.7 was 
made to change the section number to 1010.1.9. 7 
and number 7 to number 9. A decision on the 
wording was tabled until the next meeting. 

Tom Peterson left at this point in the meeting. 

A motion was made by Kenny Nichols to modify 
the current amendment for Section 1009. 7 .2 by 
changing it to 1011.5.2 and exception number 5 to 
number 3. The motion was seconded by Jeff Darr 
and passed unanimously. 

A motion was made by Chris Jensen to modify the 
current amendment for Section 1009 .15 by chang
ing the section number to 1011.11 and exception 6 
to exception 5. The motion was seconded by 
Kenny Nichols and passed unanimously. 

A motion was made by Dave Vickers to modify 
the current amendment for Section 1011.5 by 
changing the section number to 1013 .5. The mo
tion was seconded by Brad Larson and passed 
unanimously. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to modify 
the current amendment for Section 1024 by chang
ing the section to 1025. The motion was seconded 
by Gary Payne and passed with a vote of eleven in 
favor and James Williams, Jeff Darr and Paul 
Bauer voting in opposition. 

A motion was made by James Sullivan to keep the 
current amendment for Section 403.5.5 . The mo
tion was seconded by Kenny Nichols and passed 
with a vote of eleven in favor and James Williams, 



Page 4 of 4 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
February 3, 2015 

The meeting adjourned at 11: 10. 

Jeff Darr and Paul Bauer voting in opposition. 

At this point in the meeting Dave Vickers left. 

A recommendation for the current amendment for 
1028.12 was made to change the section number to 
1029.14. A decision on the wording was tabled 
until the next meeting. 

Kevin Emerson spoke to the committees in connec
tion with the review of the energy code. A copy of 
the reports by Envision Utah and the Utah Energy 
Efficiency & Conservation Plan will be sent to both 
committees. 

Note: These minutes are not intended to be a verbatim transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business conducted in 
this meeting. Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred. 

4 



UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 

March 3, 2015 
Sandy City Hall Room 341 

10000 Centennial Pkwy Sandy, UT 

STAFF: 
Dan Jones, Bureau Manager 
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary 

MINUTES 

ARCHITECTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
William Hall 
Tracy Ence (excused) 
Scott Marsell (excused) 
Jerry Jens en (absent) 

UNIFIED CODE ANALYSIS COUNCIL 
Paul Bauer (excused) 
Thomas Peterson (absent) 
Jeff Darr (excused) 
Scott Adams 
Casey Vorwaller (excused) 

VISITORS: 

Chris Jensen 
Kenny Nichols 
Gary Payne (excused) 
James Sullivan 

Jam es Williams 
Brad Larson (excused) 
Deanne Mousley 
Andrew Baxter (excused) 
Dave Vickers 

Mitch Richardson, Survey & Testing Services 

SWEAR IN NEW MEMBER 

MINUTES 

REVIEW SECTION (F) 903.2.8 

COMPLETE REVIEW OF CHAPTER 9 OF 
THE 2015 IBC AND CURRENT 
AMENDMENTS 

Tracy Ence was not present to be sworn in. 

Approval of the February 3, 2015 minutes was ta
bled until the next meeting as there was not a quo
rum present for either committee. 

Those present reviewed the current amendment for 
this section. Deanne Mousley gave a review of this 
section. Her recommendation is to modify the cur
rent amendment by adding the deletion of 
(F)903.2.8.4 and to renumber (F)903.2.8.3 . This 
will be reviewed at the next meeting. 

Deanne Mousley gave a report on her review of the 
rest of Chapter 9. It was recommended that an 
amendment be added for Section 905.3.9 and 



Page 2 of2 
Joint Meeting 
Uniform Building Code Commission 
Architectural Advisory Committee 
Unified Code Analysis Council 
March 3, 2015 

REVIEW CHAPTERS 10 THROUGH 15 

The meeting adjourned at 11 :07. 

905.8. This will be reviewed at the next meeting. 

Those present discussed the current amendment for 
Section 1008 .1. 9. 7. They are recommending that 
the amendment be deleted. This will be covered at 
the next meeting. 

The current amendment for Section 1028.12 was 
discussed. A recommendation will be made at the 
next meeting to keep the current amendment. 

A recommendation will be made at the next meet
ing to keep the current amendment for Sections 
1109.8 and 1208.4. 

Those present asked that the Structural Advisory 
Committee also review Chapter 15. 

Note: These minutes are not intended to be a verbatim transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business conducted in 
this meeting. Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred. 

2 



Significant Changes to the IBC 2015 Edition Table 509 Fire Protection from Incidental Uses 

INCIDENTAL USES SPECIFIC TO 
AM.BULATORY CARE FAClLITIES 

Room or Area 2015 me 2012 IBC 

Laboratories not classified as Group H 1-hour soparation or provido Not considored as an incidental use 
occupancies automatic sprinkler system 

Waste and linen collection rooms 1-hour separation for rooms where 1-hour regardless of ammmt of 
containers have an aggregato volume collection ' 
of 10 cubic feet or more 

Storage rooms more than 100 square 1-hour separation Not considered as an incidental use 
feet in floor area -

INCIDENTAL USES SPEClFIC TO 
GROUP 1-2 OCCUPANCfES 

Room or Area 2015 IBC 2012 IBC 

Loborntorios not classified as Group H 1-hour separation and provide 1-hour separation or provide 
occupancies automatic sprinkler system automatic sprinkler system 

Laundry rooms 1-hour separation where more than 1:hour separation or provide 
100 square feet in floor area automatic sprinkler system where 

more than 100 square feet in 
floor aroa 

Patient rooms equipped with padded 1-hour s~pnration Not considered as an incidental use 
surfaces 

Physical plant maintenance shops 1-hour separation Not considered as on incidental use 

Waste and linen coJlection rooms 1-hour for rooms where cohtainers 1-hour regardless of amount of 
have an aggrogate volwno of 10 cubic collection 
feet or more 

Storage rooms more than 100 square 1-hour separation Not considered as an incidental use 
feel in floor area 

Incidental-use requirements specific to ambulatory care facilities and Group 1-2 occupancies 

CHANGE SIGNIFICANCE: There are occasionally one or more rooms or 
spaces in a building that pose risks not typically addressed by the pro
visions for the general occupancy group under which the building is . 
classified. However, such rooms or spaces may functionally be an exten
sion of the primary use. These types of spaces are considered in the IBC to 
be incidental uses and are specifically identified nnd addressed through 
the provisions of Section 509. Modifications to Table 509 now allow for 
a more detailed analysis of those spaces that are considered to have a 
higher hazard level than the remainder of a healthcare or runbulatory care 
facility, without the need to create a mixed-occupru1cy condition. The fol
lowing incidental uses are either newly addressed in Table 509 or current 
provisions have been modified: 

0 Laboratories in Group l-2 occupancies w·here the laboratory is not 
classified· as a Group H occupancy 

- Table 509 continues 

61 



Info Items 



307. l Architectural - Unified 

308.2 Architectural - Unified 

(F)908.7 Scott Marsell 

Wasatch Fire District Wasatch County 
local amendment 
907 .2.3 Deanne Mousley 

10-7-14 

10-7-14 

IBC AMENDMENT STATUS LOG 
PENDING 

G:\Commission\067. wpd 

2-3-15 approved 

2-3-15 tabled 

2-3-15 approved 

1 



May 1, 2015 

Uniform Building Code Commission Architectural Advisory Committee 

Uniform Building Code Commission Mechanical Advisory Committee Members 
c/o Dan S. Jones 

Bureau Manager 

Division of Occ1:1pational & Professional Licensing 
160 East 300 South 

Salt Lake City, UT 84111 

Dear Advisory Committee members, 

Thank you for volunteering your time and expertise to review and assess the impacts of new building 
codes on Utah families , businesses, economy, and air quality. 

We, the undersigned members of Governor Herbert's Clean Air Action Team, are writing to express our 

support for updating Utah's construction codes to the latest energy conservation standards (2015 

International Energy Conservation Code) for homes and commercial buildings. We request that the 
Committee vote to adopt the updated code. 

Before we explain below why we think that updated energy codes are such an important air quality issue, 

we also wanted to make sure you know that updated energy codes were a unanimous recommendation of 

our group convened by Governor Herbert. The team, a diverse body including legislators, business 

representatives, experts and advocates, issued approximately 15 recommendations in October 2014 to the 

Utah Legislature and Governor Herbert, including: "Update the state building code to include the energy 

efficiency standards of the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code." 1 

Air pollution is a top concern of Utah resident and businesses, yet Utahns underestimate the contribution 

that homes and buildings play in poor air quality. In fact, homes and buildings are a growing contributor 

to Utah's air pollution, now contributing nearly 40% of the emissions that cause Utah's unhealthy air, 

according to recent data from the Utah Division of Air Quality. Inefficient new buildings contribute to 

increased air pollution, whereas energy-efficient new homes and commercial buildings represent an 

important long-term air pollution reduction strategy by reducing energy consumption and resulting 
pollution emissions over the 100+ year life of the structure. It's much more cost-effective to build-in 
energy efficient, air pollution reduction technologies during construction, rather than retrofitting a home 

after it is constructed 

As you know, Utah's current energy code for new homes is out-of-date, only requiring new homes to be 

built slightly better than the 2006 energy code. Last year, the Utah Legislature considered House Bill 285, 
which would have changed Utah's building code adoption cycle for new single family homes from a 
three-year cycle to a six-year cycle. This legislation will likely be proposed again and we believe that the 

1 http://envisionutah .net/issues/item/305-clean-air-action-team 

Page l of2 



2015 lECC should be adopted for new homes and commercial bui !dings prior to a six-year building code 

cycle taking effect. Further delays to the adoption of new energy codes increases the cost to heat and cool 
new homes, and increases the need for costly retrofits. 

While the adoption of updated energy codes often results in higher upfront construction costs, the newer 

codes also generate long-term energy reductions, lower ongoing utility bills, and air quality 

improvements. Pacific Northwest National Laboratory is currently undertaking two studies to determine 

the Utah-specific cost effectiveness of adopting the updated energy codes in residential and commercial 

buildings, and the results are expected soon. 

In addition to important air quality benefits, energy efficient new homes and buildings help keeps Utah's 

energy rates low. Growing electricity demand from new buildings in Utah is increasing the need to raise 

utility rates to build transmission lines and other utility infrastructure, which is paid for through higher 

utility rates for homeowners and businesses. Building homes to current energy conservation standards 

keeps energy costs down for everyone. 

Furthermore, adopting the 2015 IECC will lower Utah households' energy bills and avoid the need to 

make expensive fixes to home energy systems that can cost up to $5,000 and more. In fact, analysis by the 

Building Codes Assistance Project shows that adopting the 2015 IECC for new homes in Utah will keep 

$1.07 billion in the pockets of Utah homeowners between 2017 and 2040. 

The Utah Legislature relies on your expertise and review to inform the Uniform Building Code 

Commission about which building and energy codes best serve the public interest. We respectfully request 

that you give due consideration of the long-term air quality and financial impacts to Utah families and 

businesses during your review of the 2015 IECC. 

Sincerely, 

Patrice Arent 
Utah House of Representatives 

Mayor Ralph Becker 
Salt Lake City 

David Brems 
GSBS Architects 

Lonnie Bullard 
Jacobsen Construction 

Rebecca Chavez-Houck 
Utah House of Representatives 

Ryan Evans 
Salt Lake Chamber 

Dr. Robert Gillies 
State Climatologist 

Ingrid Griffee 
Utah Moms for Clean Air 

Roger P. Jackson 
FFKR Architects 

Linda Johnson 
Citizen 

Mayor Ben McAdams 
Salt Lake County 

Edward Redd 
Utah House of Representatives 

Page 2 of2 

Steve Sands 
Rio Tinto Kennecott 

Lowry Snow 
Utah House of Representatives 

Kathy Van Dame 
Wasatch Clean Air Coalition 

Sarah Wright 
Utah Clean Energy 



Utah Residential Energy Code Analysis 

Impacts of Adopting the 2015 IECC in Utah 

This fact sheet provides the potential impacts from updating Utah 's current residential energy code to the 2015 International 
Energy Conservation Code (IECC).1 

The benefits of new homes in Utah being built to the 2015 IECC are significant. If homes built in 2017 met the 2015 IECC 
then by 2040 Utah would ... 

$ Protect families from losing an estimated $95 million annually and $1.07 billion cumulatively 
in energy costs2 

Reduce energy demand by about 7.57 trillion Btu of energy annually including 3.51 trillion Btu 
in electricity, 3.22 trillion Btu in natural gas, and 0.83 trillion Btu liquefied petroleum gas3 

• Lower the projected energy demand of Utah's building sector in 2040 by 4.1%4 

Reduce cumulative C02 emissions by an estimated 5.06 million metric tons5 

• Annual C02 emission reductions equivalent to C02 emissions from 36,496 homes' energy 
use and the greenhouse gas emissions from 84,211 passenger vehicles• 

Improve Utah's Housing Stock and Avoid Costly Retrofits 

Buildings that meet or exceed the 2015 IECC are more durable, comfortable, have fewer drafts, and protect homeowners 
and tenants from high energy costs. 

Ensuring that homes are built to current energy efficiency standards is more cost-effective than retrofitting the homes 
later or providing homeowners with subsidies to reduce high energy costs. Over $20 million in public funding is spent 
annually to assist low-income Utah households with energy bills. 7 In 2013, Utah investor-owned utilities spent over $36 
million in incentive programs to upgrade the energy efficiency of homes in Utah.8• 9 Over time, strong energy codes reduce 
the need for families to rely on assistance to afford energy for their homes. 

Consumers Come Out Ahead 

Homes built to updated energy codes typically result in monthly energy 
cost savings that exceed increases in the down payment and monthly 
mortgage, 10 providing a positive cash flow for consumers. 

Lower monthly energy bills also: 

• Improve the standard of living for families 

Strengthen local economies across Utah by providing 
consumers with more disposable income 



This analysis provides the estimated statewide impact in 2040 from updating Utah's residential 
energy code by the start of 2017 to the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC). 1 

The 2015 IECC prescribes minimum energy performance requ irements that will protect Utahn's 
from high energy costs, lower the state's energy demand, and reduce C0

2 
emissions. 

FINANCIAL lfvf PACT IN 2040 

Families are protected from Losing $g5 million in energy costs 
Updating Utah's residential energy code to the 2015 IECC will protect owners and tenants of residential homes 
from losing $95 million in energy costs in 2040. The cumulative sa.vings from 2017-2040 are $1.07 billion.2 

$100 
~ 

.!!! 
0 $75 
"O 

2017 

$2 $ 

2020 

ENERGY DEMAND lfvf PACT IN 2040 

Annual Ener 

2023 2026 2029 2032 2035 

Lower the projected residential energy demand by 7.3% in 2040 

2038 2040 

Utah avoids using 7.57 trillion Btu in 2040 that includes 3.22 trillion Btu in natural gas, 3.51 .trillion Btu iii electricity, 
and 0.83 trillion Btu in liquefied petroleum gas.2•3•4 

105 
Residential Energy Demand 

85 
2017 2020 2023 2026 2029 2032 2035 

co2 Efvf/5510 s lfvf PACT IN 2040 

0.40 million metric tons of CO 
2 
emissions are avoided 

C0
2 

emission reduction is equivalent to the current average annual greenhouse gas emissions from 85,033 
passenger vehicles or the average C02 emissions from 36,853 homes' annual energy use.5 Cumulative C02 
emissions avoided from 2017-2040 are 5.06 million metric tons. 

Ill 0.5 
C02 Emissions Avoided Annually 

c 
0 0.4 ..., 
u 
·;::: 0.3 ..., 
QJ 

E 0.2 
c 
~ 0.1 0.03 
~ 0.0 

0.01 

2017 2020 

www bcap-energy.org 



[F] 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkle, .. system installed in accordance 'Nith Section 
903 .3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group Rfire area. 

[F) 903.2.8.1 Group R 3. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 
903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in Group R 3 occupancies. 

[F) 903.2.8.2 Group R 4. Condition 1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 
with Section 903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in Group R 4 Condition 1 occupancies. 

[F] 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3 shall 
be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. 

Exceptions: 
1. Detached one- and two- family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) 

constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code For One- and Two- Family 
Dwellings. 

2. Single story Group R-1 occupancies with fire areas not more than 2,000 square feet that contain 
No installed plumbing or heating, where no cooking occurs, and constructed of Type I-A, 1-B, 
II-A, or II-B construction. 

[F] 903.2.8.3 renumbered to 903.2.8.1 

[F] 903 .2.8.3 .1 renumbered to 903 .2.8.1.1 

[F] 903.2.8.3.2 renumbered to 903.2.8.1.2 

Exception: 
1. Group R-4 fire areas not more than 4,500 gross square feet and not containing more than 16 

residents, provided the building is equipped throughout with an approved fire alarm system that is 
interconnected and receives its primary power from the building wiring and a commercial power 
system. 

[F] 903.2.8.4 Care facilities . Is deleted. 



'. 




