COMBINED BALANCE SHEET & INCOME STATEMENT

FY July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015 UBC
For February 1-28, 2015

Surcharge Fees Projected (estimated only) $372,484.50 $19,549.38 $326,657.03
Carryover Credit from Previous Years (after all payments) $975,909.00
Total $1,348,393.50 $19,549.38 $326,657.03
Salary and Benefits $ 63,705.86 | $ 4520211 % 39,62967 | $ 24,076.19
Communication Services $ 50000 ($ 358119 29401 1% 205.99
Miscellaneous/Office Supplies & Printing/Library $ 50.00 (% - $ - $ 50.00
: TOTAL| $ 64,255.86 [ $ 4,556.02 1 % 39,923.68 | $ 24,332.18
Bridgerland Applied Tech College 3 2540000 % 10,346.18 | $ 12,92768 | $ 12,472.32
Davis Applied Tech College 3 - $ - $ - $ -
Dixie State College (Dixie Applied Tech College) 3 10,380.00 | $ - $ - $ 10,380.00
Salt Lake Community College 3 - $ - $ - $ -
Southwest Applied Technology College $ 9,120.00 | $ - $ - $ 9,120.00
Uintah Basin ATC $ 7,200.00 | $ - |8 411526 | $ 3.084.74
Utah Electrical JATC/IBEW $ - 1% - |3 - 1s -
TOTAL| § 52,100.00 | $ 10,346.18 | $ 17,042.94 | $ 35,057.06
ACI Intermountain Chapter $ 3,732.00 [ $ - $ - $ 3,732.00
AIA Utah Chapter $ - $ - $ - $ -
ASHRAE $ 13,975.00 | $ - $ - $ 13,975.00
Associated General Contractors - Utah / AGC-Utah $ - $ - 3 - 3 -
Associated Builders & Contractors of Utah $ - $ - $ - $ -
Beehive Chapter ICC $ 23,500.00 | $ - $ 15,120.00 | $ 8,380.00
Bornineville Chapter ICC $ 4829669 | $ - 3 26170881 % 22,125.81
Construction Specifications Institute Inc / CSI 3 - 3 - $ - $ -
Fire Marshal's Association of Utah $ - $ - 3 - $ -
IEC of Utah (Independent Electrical Contractors) $ 29,140.00 | $ 489280 % 18,222.80 | $ 10,917.20
Iron County Home Builders Association $ 8,300.001 9% - 3 3,33882 (% 4,961.18
Northern Utah Building Inspectors $ - 3 - 3 - $ -
Park City Area Home Builders Associaiton/PCAHBA $ - 3 - $ - $ -
Rocky Mountain Gas Association $ 36,550.00 | $ - $ 10,87335! % 25,676.65
Salt Lake Home Builders Association / SLHBA $ - $ - 3 - 3 -
SEAU (Structural Engineers Association) $ 21,000.00 | $ - $ - $ 121,000.00
Southern Utah Home Builders Association / SUHBA $ 12400000 | % - $ 686.58 | $ 23,313.42
Southern Utah Division IAEI $ 4400001 % - $ 587414 | $ (1,474.14)
UAPMO $ 27,650.00 | $ 499988 | % 678152 | % 20,868.48
Utah Chapter IAE] $ 26,000.00 [ $ - $ 524100 (% 20,759.00
Utah Chapter ICC $ 105,996.00 | $ 33893.17 1% 74377.00 1 % 31,619.00
Utah Construction Suppliers Association $ 7,500.00 [ $ - $ - $ 7,500.00
Utah Plumbing & Heating Contractors Association $ 10,500.00 | $ - 3 - $ 10,500.00
Utah Homebuilders Association $ - $ - $ - 3 -
Utah Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing $ - 3 - $ - $ -
Utah Valley Homebuilders Association $ - $ - $ - $ .
TOTAL] § 390,539.69 | ¢ 43,785.85 [ $ 166,686.09 | $ 223,853.60
Total Revenue (Surcharges plus carryovers) $ 1,302,566.03
Less Actual Expenditures $ 223,652.71
3 283,242.84

Less Approved Unpaid Encumbrances










DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE OO i
Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing &z"" s
160 East 300 South, Main Lobby b
P.O. Box 146741 2:1

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-6741 .‘\‘:c,i- A
(801) 530-6078 S 3

APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

(Submit prior to training program)

Request Date:  February 27, 2015 Total Estimated Instructors Fees (total a & b below): §$ 48.972
[B] New Request: a. Instructor Fees: $ 48,972

b. Instructor Expense (travel/meals): $ N/A
D Additional Funding Request: Code Books (if requesting): $ 0
*Total Grant Amount Requested: § 489%2- 10,300
* If total amount requested is MORE than the lowest of items 1-2 below, include a brief explanation of costs. Title and price of

code books must be specified. Attach page 2 of this form. Note: SEAU intends to use some of its own funds for this initiative and
requests a grant in the amount of $40,000.

We understand and acknowledge that if this application is approved, the maximum amount that will be reimbursed
will be the lowest of items 1-3 below. If appropriate, the amount may be reduced under items 4 and 5:

1. $10.00 per student hour of actual instruction. (# students actually attending x # hours course duration x $10.00)

2. The actual reimbursable costs supported by paid invoices not to exceed # 3 or

3. The amount of grant as requested above (although additional costs may be paid if the cost results from excess
attendance over anticipated).

4. Funding grants will be reimbursed only for expenditures which have been negotiated in good faith to ensure
the best reasonable value.

5. Any instructor fees in excess of $150.00 per hour will be subject to further review and approval by the Committee,
the Division and the Department. (This is a maximum amount established for review purposes only and is not
intended to be used as a guaranteed amount. Good faith negotiations are required as in item 4 above.)

Regquesting Organization: Structural Engineer's Association of Utah (SEAL Federal 1.D. #  CliE

Street Address: P-O. Box 581292

Contact Person: Jerod Johnson, President Email Address: JJohnson@reaveley.com
Phone: 801-505-4016 Fax: 801-485-0911

Event Title: 2015 SEAU Snow Load Education Initiative

Date(s) of Training: See accompanying documentation Location(s);  Not determined

Training Objectives: Develop a snow load educational initiative for engineers, building officials and plans examiners.

Projected Number of Students: 1000+ Projected Number of Hours of Instruction: 1.5
Jerod Johnson SEAU President
Name of Authorized Representative (Print) Title
% 2/27/2015
Sig uyo/f Authorized Representative Date of Signature

Revised 1-29-2015




APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

We request the UBCC's consideration for the following reasons...

1. Our organization is constantly contacted by building officials and design professionals in regards to the snow load
requirements included in Utah Code Section 15A-3-107. The snow loads included in this section of the “State Construction and
Fire Codes Act” was incorporated into the code based upon a study performed by SEAU in 1990. This outdated study only
considers site elevation when determining ground snow loads, and is based upon very few data points throughout the state. The
purpose of the 2015 SEAU Snow Load Education initiative would be to provide the State of Utah with a an up-to-date,
state-of-the-art snow load determination tool similar to what is being used in surrounding states which would then be used to
update our current state amendments. The initiative primarily includes the gathering of snow load information and then the
development of this information into an educational format that can be used {o instruct design professionals, building officials,
contractor organizations and plans examiners throughout the state. It will also be incorporated into the next version of ASCE 7.

2. The purpose of the education funds is to “provide education regarding codes and code amendments” (per Section
R156-15A-231). After developing the educational material mentioned in ltem #1 above, SEAU will work jointly with the UBCC to
develop any necessary changes to the State code amendments in relation to snow loads. SEAU will also provide training
opportunities with respect to this initiative as indicated in the attached documentation.

3. While we are a non-profit organization, we do have some funds that we can use to help pay for this study, yet we are limited to
at most $10,000 while the study itself will cost around $48,972. For that purpose we have requested $40,000 be covered by the
1% building permit surcharge funds.

Supporting documentation is provided in file accompanying this application. Included are the following:

1. SEAU Declaration of Intent for 2015 SEAU Snow Load Education Initiative.

2. Fee Proposal from primary instructor, Dr. Marc Maguire, Utah State University.

3. Forecast of educational opportunities with various organizations and associations in the Utah Building Industry.
4. Meeting Minutes from October 2, 2014, UBCC-SAC reflecting endorsement of concept.

Revised 1-29-2015



2015 SEAU Snow Load Education Initiative

February 27, 2015
To Whom It May Concern:

The Structural Engineers Association of Utah (SEAU) seeks
to undertake the “2015 SEAU Snow Load Education
Initiative”. This initiative seeks to gather snow load
information from across the state, assemble it in
accordance with state-of-the-art statistical methods and
develop an educational protocol for disseminating this
information to building officials, engineers and inspectors
that they may learn the most appropriate snow loads to
use for the design of new infrastructure.

oV STy,

(o)
¢ &
M gu??

C,
“Arion o

STRUCTURAL ENGINEERS
ASSOCIATION OF UTAH

P.O. Box 581292
Salt Lake City, Utah 84158-1292

Jerod G. Johnson, Presidenr

Don Barfuss Jr., Vice President/President Elect
Scorr Roche, Past Presidenr

Jereiny Achter, Treasurer

Jason Christensen, Secrerary,/Fistorian

Tait Ketcham, Member of the Board

Brett Goodinan, Memnber of the Board Flecr

Inasmuch as SEAU does not have sufficient expertise for this initiative, SEAU seeks to
retain the services of Dr. Marc Maguire from Utah State University to act as the primary
resource for assembling the necessary snow load information so that it can be
developed into an educational format suitable for presentation to individuals and
organizations throughout the state. Inasmuch as Dr. Maguire’s efforts for this initiative
will be extensive, SEAU seeks state assistance through a funding approval from the
UBCC Education Advisory Committee. SEAU is willing to commit $5,000 to $10,000 of its
own funds, but is not in a position to totally fund the initiative with projected expenses
of approximately $48,972. Please see the attached proposal from Dr. Maguire for

further information.

Whereas Dr. Maguire will be the principal resource for assembling this information,
SEAU plans to enlist no less than four of its own members to work with Dr. Maguire with
respect to this initiative. These individuals, along with Dr. Maguire will become the
primary instructors tasked with presenting the educational materials at seminars,
conferences and other educational venues. The accompanying outline lists the
projected educational opportunities where this information will be presented (subject
to change depending on timing for gathering information). The proposed instructors are

all SEAU members and include (but are not limited to):

Jerod G. Johnson, PhD, SE, SEAU President
Scott Roche, SE, SEAU Past President
Chris Kimball, SE, SEAU Past President

el

Scott Russell, SE, Member of ASCE 7 Committee on Snow Load

The educational materials assembled for this initiative will also serve as a replacement
to the information found in SEAU’s Snow Load Study produced in 1990. The gathered
snow load information for this initiative is anticipated to be far more reliable, accurate



and prudent than the information of 1990 study. We anticipate the educational
materials gathered for the 2015 SEAU Snow Load Education Initiative will effectively
replace the 1990 SEAU Snow Load Study and will be adopted by amendment into Utah
State Law. To that end, SEAU sought the endorsement of Utah’s UBCC Structural
Advisory Committee (SAC). On October 2, 2014, The SAC unanimously endorsed the
concept of this initiative and indicated its intentions to pass its recommendations to the
Uniform Building Code Commission and then to Business and Labor Interim Committee.
Minutes from this meeting of the SAC are available online but have also been included
herein. Based on feedback gathered thus far, SEAU has every reason to believe
information gathered for the 2015 SEAU Snow Load Education Initiative, once properly
reviewed and vetted by the appropriate organizations, will become adopted as part of
the Utah State Code.

SEAU is pleased to serve engineers in Utah by being the vehicle which can make
initiatives such as this a reality. SEAU looks forward to the educational opportunities
this will provide and the advancements this will enable with respect to designing for
snow in the State of Utah.

Respectfully,

Jep6d G _JShnson, PhD, SE
EAUAPresident



2015 SEAU Snow Loading Educational Initiative
Marc Maguire, Primary Manager
Tam Chantem, Yan Sun, Initiative Mangers
Utah State University

Statewide Educational Need

Engineers in the State of Utah currently determine ground snow loads (GSL) from
ASCE 7-10 Figure 7-1 or values produced in the 1990 Utah Snow Load Study. Several
western states, because of rapid elevation changes in the mountains, have undertaken
efforts to reproduce up-to-date and user friendly GSL maps using historical weather
data. The purpose of this initiative is to provide the Structural Engineers Association of
Utah (SEAU) with a state-of-the-art, up-to-date snow load determination tool
comparable to surrounding states that SEAU can use to educate engineers, inspectors
and building officials throughout the state.

Background

The team has identified 127 SNOTEL locations, 62 Snow Course locations (managed
by the Natural Resources Conservation Service). Data from 50+ NOAA/NWS NOWData
stations will be considered, however there is a significant amount of missing data.
Additional sources of snowfall records may be obtained from NOAA Quality Controlled
Local Climatological (QCLC) Data and NWS COOP locations, where volunteers have
taken weather observations. Care must be taken to ensure all data is statistically
significant, as NOAA QCLC data is only available since 2005 and several SNOTEL
stations have been added relatively recently.

Clearly the quality and quantity of data varies widely and considerable effort must be
used to obtain the required information regarding snowfall. SNOTEL stations are widely
considered the most reliable sources of snow depth and GSL. However even these
stations are often missing considerable data or have other issues which could preclude
their use. Furthermore, some stations (e.g. SNOTEL) report snow water equivalent
(SWE) which can converted to GSL by the density of water. Other stations (e.g. Snow
Course) typically provide snow depth, without information on snow density.

Several western states have used differing statistical methodologies to assemble this
information. The most universally accepted is the Parameter-Elevation Regressions on
Independent Slopes Model, which was developed specifically for rapidly changing
elevation regions. This model creates linear regression parameters at grid locations on
topographic maps for climate data using point weather station data. A simplified outline
of this process is presented in Objective 2 below. This methodology has been used
extensively in climate studies to establish several climatic variabies around the world.



Work Plan

The end goal for this initiative will be twofold, (1) to deliver to the SEAU a web and/or
windows based application to present ground snow loads at any given latitude and
longitude in Utah and (2) develop a robust education initiative that will allow SEAU to
effectively teach and disseminate this information to engineers practicing in Utah. To
accomplish these end goals, the following tasks must be completed:

Objective 1. Collect and filter data

Data must be collected from several sites around Utah and even the surrounding states
for interpolation purposes. National Resources Conservation Service, National Weather
Service and the National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration are all sources of
data relating to snow depth. Other sources of data will be considered upon initiation of
work. This objective is crucial and will likely be the most difficult and time consuming.

Not all measurement stations in each database will provide quality information, data
must be filtered. For instance, only stations with a statistically significant data will be
considered. Filters applied will be related to minimum data volume and minimum
absolute snow load observed. Special considerations will be made for each site
depending on data collected. The method of kernel density will be used to compare
empirical distributions to estimated probability distributions for each station to assess
their statistical significance. Past programs have arbitrarily excluded stations without a
significance test (Cunningham 2007). Furthermore, some weather stations do not
collect SWE, but rather depth of snow. In these cases, assumptions must be made
about snow density using established relationships (e.g. Theisen et al. 2004).

Objective 2. GSL Determination and Interim Report

Using the filtered and formatted data from Objective 1, GSL will be established using
techniques previously used for western states like Colorado and Oregon. The
methodology is as follows:

1. Random variable defined for each site for maximum snow even for each year of
record;
2. Fit test cumulative distribution functions to estimate the probability behavior of
SWE at a given site;
Determine 50-year mean recurrence interval GSL for each site;
4. Using a digital elevation map for the State of Utah, calculate a climate-elevation
relationship for each grid point
a. Using the elevation and climate data from the station data, including
appropriate station weighting

w



b. Weight grid points appropriately according the distance from snow
stations, elevation, topographic facets and inversion layer estimation (Daly
et al. 2002, Daly et al. 2007)
5. Interpolate the grid cell data to allow for easy user inputs of latitude and longitude
to obtain GSL at any given location in Utah. This tool can be used to create Utah
GSL maps for printing or graphical display.

Objective 2 will culminate in a transparent presentation of Utah GSLs and an interim
report for review by SEAU and the Uniform Building Codes Commission Structural
Advisory Committee (UBCC SAC), with all work detailed in an open fashion. This will
allow SEAU and UBCC SAC to comment, review and revise the work, if necessary,
prior to application development (Objective 3) and dissemination (Objective 4).

Objective 3. Develop application to present ground snow loads

Building upon the program developed in Objective 2, the team will develop a web
based and/or windows based program (upon request) which will accept latitude and
longitude inputs to give a GSL output for that location.

Objective 4: Education Plan Development and Final Report

Building upon the interim report, a finalized report will be prepared including
recommendations from the SEAU and UBCC SAC. An educational protocol will be
developed to present the gathered information at multiple education venues and events
in coordination with SEAU and included in the final report.

Schedule and Budget

The budget includes salary and benefits for the three investigators, graduate student,
including tuition and undergraduate wages. A computer is budgeted at $2000. Costs for
in-state travel of $1,000 are assumed for meetings with the SEAU board and
education/dissemination. Table 2 presents the estimated timeline for each objective,
measured from the start date.

Table 1 - Project Budget

Marc Maguire Salary and Benefits $ 7,300
Tam Chantem Salary and Benefits $ 2,920
Yan Sun Salary and Benefits $ 2,920
Graduate Student Salary Benefits and Tuition | $ 17,015
Undergraduate Wages and Benéfits $ 2,164
Materials $ 2,000
Travel $ 1,000
Indirect Costs (41.6%, excluding tuition) $ 13,653
Total $ 48,972




Table 2 — Initiative Timeline

Task

Objective 1: Data Collection and Filtering
Objective 2: GSL Gathering/Report
Objective 3. Application Development
Obijective 4: Education Plan and Final Report

References

Cunningham, R., (2007) “Ground Snow Loads in Colorado”. Structural Engineers
Association of Colorado.

Daly, C., Gibson W., Taylor, GH. Johnson, G., Pasteris, P., (2002). “A knowledge-based
approach to the statistical mapping of climate”. Climate Research 22: 99-113.

Daly C, Smith J, McKane R. (2007). “High-resolution spatial modeling of daily weather
elements for a catchment in the Oregon Cascade Mountains”, USA. Journal of
Applied Meteorology and Climatology 46: 1565-1586.

Sack, R., Sheikh-Taheri, A. (1986). “Ground and Roof Snow Loads for Idaho”
Department of Civil Engineering at the University of Idaho. Pp 49.

Theisen, G, Keller, M, Stephens, J, Videon, F., Schilke, J. (2004) “Snow Loads for
Structural Design in Montana”. Civil Engineering Department, Montana State
University. Bozeman, MT.

Research Team

Marc Maguire, Assistant Professor of Structural Engineering, teaches Reliability of
Structures, where statistical load and resistance models are combined to quantify
probability of failure. He is currently working on transportation asset management
projects involving using techniques like Regression, Markovian Decision Processes and
Fuzzy Sets for Wyoming Department of Transportation.

Tam Chantem, Assistant Professor of Electrical and Computer engineering, has
expertise in the development of efficient run-time algorithms and experience in software
design. She is currently involved in several research projects, including one funded by
the National Science Foundation, which require history-based predictions and
probability theory.

Yan Sun, Assistant Professor of Statistics works with statistical theory and applications
to time series, spatial and temporal data. She will help developing and validating the
Parameter-Elevation Regressions model to predict snow loads for the digital map of
Utah.



2015 SEAU Snow Loading Education Initiative

Association

Projected Educational Events

Timeframe*

Event

SEAU 4th Annual Education Conference
SEAU Monthy Membership Meeting

Utah Chapter of ICC

Beehive Chapter of ICC
Bonneville Chapter of ICC
AIA - Utah Chapter

ASCE - Northern Utah Branch
ASCE - Wasatch Branch

ASCE - Central Utah Branch
ASCE - Southern Utah Branch
Update to the UBCC-SAC**

February 23-24, 2016
November 17, 2016
Week of February 15, 2016
April, 2016

October, 2016
October, 2016
Spring, 2016

Spring, 2016

Spring, 2016

Spring, 2016
November, 2015

Conference
General Meeting
Yearly Conference
Yearly Conference
Yearly Conference
Yearly Conference
Monthly Meeting
Monthly Meeting
Monthly Meeting
Monthly Meeting
Monthly Meeting

Note: SEAU also intends to prepare technical articles outlining the objectives and aim of
the 2015 SEAU Snow Load initiative for publication in newsletters of these organizations.

* This is the approximated projected timeframe and may be subject to change.
** progress and status report, potential rough draft of educational materials.



FEB-10-2015 1627 Fromlvins City PW To:8015306511 Page:2/3

DEPARTMENT OT COMMERCE

Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing
- 160 Tast 300 South, Mam T.obby

P.0. Box 146741

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-6741

(801) 530-6078

APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

(Submit prior to training program)

Request Date:  February 10, 2015 Total Estimated Instructors Fees (total a & b below):  $_1429
@) New Request: a. Instructor Fees: $ 1000

b. Instructor Expense (travel/meals): $ 429
Additi Fundi "
[ ditional Funding Request Code Books (If requesting): s
*Total Grant Amount Requested: $ 2600.00
=it total amount requested is MORE than the lowsst of items 1-2 below, include a brief axplanation of costs. Title and price of

code books must be specified. Attach page 2 of this form.

We underatand and acknowledge that if this application is approved, the maximum amount that will be reimbursed
will be the lowest of items 13 below. If approprlate, the amount may be reduced under Items 4 and 5:

1... $10.00 per student hour of actual instruction. (# students actusily attending x # hours course duration x $10.00)
2.+ -The actual:reimbursable costs supported by paid invoices not to exceed # 3 or
3. The'arriourit of grant as requested above (although additional costs may be paid if the cost results from excess
- gttendance over anticipated).
4. Fundmg grants ‘will be reimbursed only for expenditures which have been negotiated in good faith to ensure
the best reasonable value,
5. Any instructor fees in excess of $150.00 per hour will be subject to further review and approval by the Committee,
the Divigion and the Department. (This is a maximum amount established for review purposes only and is not
intended to be used as a guaranteed amount. Good faith negotiations are required as in item 4 above.)

~_ Requesting.Organization: ~_Southern Utah Division IAEI Federal 1.D. #: SSeyumiix.

Street Address 55 N Main

R L e AN

City:  Ivins State: Utah Zip: 84738

' Contad perso il Kevln Rudd Email Addreas: Krudd@ivins.com

Event Title: 2014.NEC Update

Date(s) of Trai September 18, 2015 Location(s): St George, Utah
Training Ob}ecﬂves F‘rovsde continuing education for electricians and building ingpectors in Southem Utah
Projected Number of Students: 50 Projected Number of Hours of Instruction: 8
Kevin Rudd L Secretary of Southern Utak Division IAE]
Name of Authorized Representatlve (Print) Title
| 5/10 /15
~ Signature of Authorized Representative Daté of Sighature
A A EDUCATION COMMITTEE ACTION 7 (€ 300
Adv!sory Commlttee Recommendation: #Favorable O Unfavorable Amount Recommended: $
RE;'BJ(;};: P ?OV‘A\V‘Q K‘e 0631 pate: D 31 A S
et in b -, RTMENT OF COMMERGE ACTION .
SR O Not Approved (1 Approved Amount: §
Bureau Manager: Data: I
Division Director: . Date: / /
Department Director: _ i : Date: / /

Revised 1-29-2015 <o



FEB-10-2015 1627 From:Ivins City PW To:8015306511 Page:3/3

DEPARTMENT OF COMMFERCT

Division of Occupational und Professional Licensing
160 East 300 South, Main Lobby

P.0O). Box 146741

Salt Take City, UT 84114-6741

(801) 530-6078

APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

(Submit prior to training program)

ok

Request Date:- -«Feb;uarv 10, 2015 Total Estimated Instructors Fees (tatal a & b below):  $_1429
New Request, - .. . a. Instructor Fees: $ 1000

b. Instructor Expense (travel/meals): $ 429

Code Baoks (if requesting): $

*Total Grant Amount Requested: $ 2600.00
* If total amount requested is MORE than the lowest of items 1-2 below, include a brief explanation of costs. Title and price of
code books must be spacifisd. Attach page 2 of this form.

[] Additionai ‘Fun'di'njg Request:

-We understand and acknowledge that If this application is approved, the maximum amount that will be reimbursed
will be the lowest of items 1-3 below. If appropriate, the amount may be reduced under items 4 and 5:

1. $10.00:per student hour of actual Insiruction. (# students actuslly attending x # hours course duration x $10.00)

2..-The actual reimbursable costs supported by paid Involces not to exceed # 3 or

3. The amolnt of grant as requested above (although additionsl costs may be paid if the cost results from excess
attendance over anticlpated).

4. Funding granté will be reimbursed only for expendiiures which have been negotiated in good faith to ensure
the best réasonable valus.

5 Any mstruc!or fees in excess of $150.00 per hour will be subject to further review and approval by the Committes,
the Division and the Department. (This is @ maximum amount established for review purposes only and is not

lnle_nded to be used as a guaranteed amount, Good faith negotiations are required as in item 4 abovs.)

Southemn Utah Division 1AE! Federal |.D. # R

City:~ State: Ytah Zip: 84738
Contact Person: Kevin Rudd Ermail Address: krudd@ivins.com

Phone: 435634- o753 Fax.  435656-2286

Everit ’:'[‘it[e 7 .CQde éeq:nrements for Solar PV Systems

Date(s) of Tralnlng: APl 15, 2016 Location(s): St George, Utah

Training Objecﬁ\:/esf‘ Provide cantinuing education for electricians and building inspectors in Southem Utah

Projected Number of Students: 50 Projected Number of Hours of Instruction: 8
Kevin Rudd ., ,'"; Secretary of Southern Utah Division IAE!
Name of Authoﬂzed Repmsentatlva (Print) Title

Ko 2/10 [l
Signature of Authorized Representative Date of Stgnature

Andeess Be iR EDUCATION COMMITTEE ACTION o
dwsory Committee Recommendation: Jd Favorable 0 Unfavorable Amount Recommended: § Léf‘@

Rt;ason o 'F\)z\dmy Ze,quﬂ" pate: 3 LTS

{ DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE ACTION

I Mot Approved Q. Approved Amount: §
Bureau Manager: _ Date: / /
Divizion Director: Date: / /

Department Dirsctor:,_ Date: ___ / /

Revised 129201850







APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 - Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
Manual D - Residential Duct Systems, 3rd Edition $81.95 each

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellanecus Copies)
$1639.00 (Manual D)

$160.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3239 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
NFPA 70®: National Efectrical Code® (NEC®), 2014 Edition $32.00

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)
$2300.00 (2014 NEC)
$200.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3940.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application,

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
2015 International Plumbing Code $84.00

Total Cost Estimate

$1800.00 (Instructor)

$400.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)
$2100.00 (2015 IPC)

$300.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$4625.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
Building Code Essentials, 2015 edition® $38.95

Total Cost Estimate

$915.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)

$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)

$1947.50 (Building Code Essentials, 2015 edition®)
$300.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3387.50 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 - Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student;
NEC® Analysis of Changes $68.50

Total Cost Estimate

$2400.00 (Instructor)

$400.00 {Facility Costs)

$25.00 {Miscelianeous Copies)

$1712.50 (2014 NEC Analysis of Change)
$400.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$4937.50 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
Ugly's Electrical References 2014 $15.95

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)

$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)
$398.75 (2014 NEC Uglys Book)
$200.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$2038.75 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
2015 International Plumbing Code $84.00

Total Cost Estimate

$915.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Capies)
$1680.00 (2015 IPC)

$120.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$2940.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
Energy Code Essentials, 2015 edition® $29.95

Total Cost Estimate

$915.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)

$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)

$1497.50 (Building Code Essentials, 2015 edition®)
$300.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$2937.50 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
Significant Changes to the IPC®, IMC®, and IFGC®, 2015 Edition $45.00

Total Cost Estimate

$915.00 (Insiructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Capies)
$900.00 (2015 IPC)

$120.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$2160.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
NFPA 70e®: 2015 Edition $67.50

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (Instructar)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)
$1687.50 (2015 NFPA 70e)
$200.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3327.50 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 - Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
NFPA 70®: National Electricai Code® (NEC®), 2014 Edition $92.00

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscelianeous Copies)
$2300.00 (2014 NEC)

$200.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3940.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief explanation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
NFPA 70®: National Electrical Code® (NEC®), 2014 Edition $92.00

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (Instructor)

$200.00 (Facility Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)
$2300.00 (2014 NEC)
$200.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3940.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015






APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

Page 2 — Required if total amount requested is MORE than the lowest amount of items 1-3 on page one of application.

Include a brief expianation for requested amount:

The following standard will be furnished to each student:
NFPA 70®: National Electrical Code® (NEC®), 2014 Edition $92.00

Total Cost Estimate

$1215.00 (instructor)

$200.00 (Faciiity Costs)
$25.00 (Miscellaneous Copies)
$2300.00 (2014 NEC)
$200.00 (CEU Upload Fee)

$3940.00 Estimated Total

Revised 1-29-2015



DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE ,,r;‘,:?_'i’&;;.
Division of Gecupational and Professional Licensing e A
160 East 300 South, Main Lobby

P.0. Box 146741

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-6741
(801) 530-6078

APPLICATION FOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

(Submit prior 1o training program)

Request Date; March3, 2015

§/] New Request: § 30.000 Total Grant Amount Requested: § 30,000
(I Additional Funding Request: S _____ Total Instructors Fees (estimated): $ 18.000
Instructor Fees: $0

Instructor Expenses (travel/meals): §90

We understand and acknowledge that even if this application is approved the maximum amount that will be reimbursed
will be the lowest of items 1-4 below. [fappropriate, may be reduced under items 5 and 6:
1.1f the event is not held $0.00 cost is reimbursable
2. 510.00 per student hour of actual instruction. (¥ students actually attending x # hours course duration x §10.00)
3. The actual reimbursable costs supported by paid invoices not to exceed # 4 or
4. The amount of grant as requested above (although additional costs may be paid if the cost results from excess
attendance over anticipalted).
5. Funding grants will be reimbursed only for expenditures which have been negotiated in good faith to ensure
the best reasonable value,
6. Any instructor fees in excess of $150.00 per hour will be subject to further review and approval by the
Committee, the Division and the Department. (Thisis a maximum amount established for review purposes only
and is not intended to be used as a guaranteed umonnt. Good faith negotiations are required as in item 5 above.)

Requesting Organization: Bonneville Chapter of ICC Federal 1D. #; iy

Sireet Address: P-O.Box672

City: Farmington State: Ut Zip: 84025
Contact Person: Michael Bosch Email Address: mbosch@co.weber.ut.us
Phone:; 801-399-8379 Fax: 801-399-8852

Event Title: 22nd Annual Fall Educational Institule

Date(s) ofTraining: October 27,28 and 29th, 2015 LOC&IiOH(S).‘ Utah Cutural Celebration Center

Training Objectives: Provide up to date code training for code, fire officials, design professionals and contractors.

Projected Number of Students: 300 Projected Number of Hours of Instruction: 24
Michael Bosch Chapter Treasurer
Name of Authorized Representative (Print) Title
W \’\bw.uj_/ 03/04/2015
Signature of Authorized Representative Date of Signature
4 EDUCATION COMMITTEE ACTION 2

Adv1sory Comumittee Recommendatlon %Favorable l:l Unfuvorable ,
Date‘ 7/ 15‘-Amount Recommended 3 20 000 i Ll :
Reason, : s

: » DEPARTMENT OF CO’VI\IERCE ACTIO’\‘

0 Not Approved - D Approved Amount: 8
Bureau Manager: . Date: _ / /
Division Diiector: , Date: /| ‘
Department Dire¢tor: Date: [/ /-

Revised 01-28-2014



DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing
160 East 300 South, Main Lobby

P.0O. Box 146741

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-6741

(801) 530-6078

APPLICATION IFOR BUILDING CODE TRAINING FUNDS GRANT

(Submit prior to training prograni)

Request Date; March 3, 2015

/] New Request: § 2.000 Total Grant Amount Requested: $ 2,000
[J Additional Funding Request: S _____ Total Instructors Fees (estimated): 3 600
{nstructor Fecs: §0

Instructor Expenses (travel/meals); $0

We understand and acknowledge that even if this application is approved the maximum amount that will be reimbursed
will be the lowest of iterns 1-4 below. If appropriate, may be reduced under items $ and 6;
1.1f the event is not held $0.00 cost is reimbursable
2. $10.00 per student hour of actual instruction. (¥ snidents actually attending x # hours course duration x $10.00)
3. The actual reimbursable costs supported by paid invoices not to exceed # 4 or
4. The amount of grant as requested above (a/though additional costs may be paid if the cost results from excess
attendance over anticipated).
5. Funding grants will be reimbursed only for expenditures which have been negotiated in good faith to ensure
the best reasonable value,
6. Auny instructor fees in excess of $150.00 per hour will be subject to further review and approval by the
Cominittee, the Division and the Department. (This is a maximum wnount established for review purposes only
and is not intended to be used as a guaranteed amount. Good faith negotiations are required as in item 35 above.)

Requesting Organization: Bonneville Chapter of ICC Federal 1D, #: (i

Street Address; P-O.Box 872

City: Farmingion State; Ut Zip: 84025
Contact Person; Michael Bosch Email Address: mbosch@co.weber.ut.us
Phone: 801-399-8379 Fax: 801-299.8e52

Event Title; Spring Thing

Date(s) of Training: 2nd Tuesday of either March or April 2016 Location(s): Farmington City Rec. Center

Training Objectivcs: Provide up lo dale code {raining for code, fire officials, design professionals and conlractors.

Projected Number of Students: 50 Projected Number of Hours of Instruction: ¢
Mictiael Bosch Chapter Treasurer

Name of Authorized Representative (Print) Title

\J\)\L\M \){é’\suj'— 03/04/2015

Signature of Authorized Representative Date of Signature

L EDUCATION COMMITTEE ACTION
S _ ':.Advis‘ovry Commiittee Recommendagion: ;{ Favorable [ Unfavorable
Date: i/_ll/_liAmmmt Recommended: $ E 000.2=
Redsol: Coeding e
, =Pl 1

: : DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE ACTION
U Not Approved O Approved Amount; §

BureanManager: Date: { /
Division Director: Date: _ / /’
Department Director: Date: [/ /

Revised 01-28-2014



DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing
160 East 300 South, Main Lobby

P.O. Box 146741

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-6741

(801) 530-6078

We, the sponsors of the proposed training, are requesting reimbursement for the following costs which we have incurred
and for which we have attached an Iinvoice, the original receipts. a roster of attendees, and a copv of the training

REQUEST FOR REIMBURSEMENT

(Submit after completion date of the training program)

announcement, advertising and agenda.

Select one:

We provided the training program as outlined in our original application. (Complete Sections A & C)

0 We provided the training program as outlined in our original application but request committee approval for
additional reimbursement above the lesser of the $10 per student hour or cost of approved actual expenditures.

(Complete Sections A, B & C.)

] We did not hold the training as outlined In the original application but are requesting reimbursement for allowable

expenses. (Complete Section B & C)

Section A:

Instructor's Name(s):  Chris Jensen

Seminar Title/Subject:  Contractor Seminar 2012 1BC, 2012 IRC, 2012 IEC
Date(s) of Training: 6 February 2015

Location of Training:  BATC Logan Utah

Educational Expenditures

1. Total Instructor Fees and Travel/Meals(not to excead §3,000 for an 8 hr day} Total a and b below $ 807.38
a. Instructor Fees: $ 750.00
b. Instructor Travel (total i-iv): $ 5738

i. Airfare $

ii. Mileage $

fii. Meals $

iv. Other (please specify) $ 57.38 _ FICA for Instructor
2. Textbooks, Workbooks, Code Update Books (Use Section C for Code books) g0

Titles:
3. Facility Cost: $ 200
4. Audio Visual Equipment: 0
5. Printing $ 25
6. Postage and handling $0
7. Other (please detail). $
Total of Educational Expenditures (1-7): _$ 1032.38
Cost Per Student
1. Number of actual students in attendance: 21
Training duration in hours: 8 -

3. Total hours of training (line 1 x line 2) 126

Maximum Cost Per Student Hour $10.00 (line 3 x $10.00) $ 1260

Total Reimbursement Request (Lower of Total Educational Expenditures or Maximum Cost Per Student): $ 1164.38

Revised 10-22-2014










Section B:

1. Code Books (No more than oneftitie/attendee. Application must include a roster.)

Title(s):
Number purchased: ____ Total cost of Code Books: §
2. Advertising Materials Postcard design charges .5hrs @ $30/hr % 15
3. Printing Costs $ 32.65
4. Delivery or Mailing Costs: $ 68
5. DOPL Licensee Mailing List: $ 19.34
6. DOPL Continuing Education upload fee: $
Total Section B Reimbursement (fines 7-6): ¢ 134.99
Total From Section A (Carried over from First Page): $ 2080
Total Reimbursement Request (Sections A & B): $ 2214.99

Section C:

iwe hereby verify that these expenses have been paid by our organization. l/we further verify that the instructor (if training
was held) was adequately qualified by education and experience to teach the course, and was adequately prepared to
teach the course by making an outline of the program, making appropriate audio or visual aids, preparing or arranging for
handouts or study guides, arranging for any needed equipment and provided the training for the full time period and
subject matter presented in the funding request.

I/we also verify we have engaged in good faith negotiations to obtain the best reasonable value for the costs associated
above.

Southwest Applied Technology College ey
Organization Name Federal 1.D. Number
Todd Hess Employer Services Director
Authorized Representative (Type/Print) Title
% 3/2/2015

Signature Date

Revised 1-29-2015









VADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 2

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?usage&month=2015-01

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Bagks. If you need any older

usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207

Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Monthly Package Usage, January 2015

Title Granted
NFPA Standards in 2012 I-Codes Package 39
ASHRAE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package 8
ASCE Standards Referenced in 2012 [-Codes Package 23
Free Ipubs Package to Paid Users 17
ASTM Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package 14
ASME Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package 4
ASCE Free Publications Package 2
Utah (UT) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 7
Colorado (CO) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 1
Free Ipubs Package to Paid Users 3
Arizona (AZ) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 1
FEMA Standards Package 1
Maryland (MD) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 1
North Carolina (NC) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 1
Total: 122
Monthly Book Usage, January 2015
Title Granted
ICC A117.1 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities 2009 5
ICC 300-2012: Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating, and Grandstands 2012 4
ICC 400-2012: Standard on the Design and Construction of Log Structures 2012 4
ICC 600 - 2008:; Standard for Residential Construction in High-Wind Regions 2008 1
27

Total:

Download as CSV

Exceeded

c O ©O O O O O O O O O O o o o

Download as CSV

Exceeded

0

e O O O

3/17/2015 10:18 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

20f2

Title

State Construction and Fire Codes Act, Title 15A Chapters 1 through 5 - July 1, 2012 0
Utah Code - State Construction and Fire Codes Act, Title 15A, July 2013 0

Public Safety Code - Utah Fire Prevention and Safety Act, July 2012 0

Utah State Fire Code State Construction and Fire Code Act 0

R710. Public Safety, Fire Marshal. R710-4. Buildings Under the Jurisdiction of the State Fire
Prevention Board. 0

State Construction Code Administration and Adoption of Approved State Construction Code
Rule, R156-15A - Sept 20120

General Rules of the Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing, R156-1 - March 11,
20130

Division of Facilities Construction and Management, Design Requirements - June 11, 2009 0

Total:

Granted
2
2
1

1

27

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?usage&month=2015-01

Exceeded

0

o O o o

3/17/2015 10:18 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 9

My Subscriptions

My Profile

My Users

My Transactions

Account Usage

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207

Grant: A successful access to a resource.
Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Package Accesses, January 2015

Title

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ICC 300-2012: Bleachers,
Folding and Telescopic
Seating, and Grandstands
2012

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

User

dan@ckrengineers.com

todd.bischoff@flsmidth.com

todd.bischoff@flsmidth.com

bwelch@vbfa.com

winp@whw-engineering.com

jed@mvengr.net

jerryt@nslcity.org

dpcoupe@graniteschools.org

chawe@norwestcorp.com

chawe@norwestcorp.com

stevenp@arwengineers.com

adamz@designwestarchitects.com

Personal
User

IP Address

173.8.94,105

70.103.193.66

70.103.193.66

68.178.116.130

50.73.41.177

73.3.105.107

199.127.127.58

205.127.88.58

216.51.42.18

216.51.42.18

50.73.45.57

50.200.145.162

Time

2015-01-15
09:58:09

2015-01-15
10:00:28

2015-01-15
10:01:22

2015-01-15
10:04:32

2015-01-15
10:07:04

2015-01-15
10:11:31

2015-01-15
10:14:37

2015-01-15
10:15:38

2015-01-15
10:15:43

2015-01-15
10:17:37

2015-01-15
10:22:32

2015-01-15
10:26:01

Download as CSV

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

20f9

Title

Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ICC 300-2012: Bleachers,
Folding and Telescopic
Seating, and Grandstands
2012

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Utah State Fire Code State
Construction and Fire Code
Act0

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

Utah Code - State
Construction and Fire
Codes Act, Title 15A, July
20130

ICC 400-2012: Standard on
the Design and
Construction of Log
Structures 2012

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

State Construction and Fire
Codes Act, Title 15A
Chapters 1 through 5 - July
1,20120

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

User

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

kurtm@cmautah.com

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org

dpayne@vcho.com

dpayne@vcbo.com

adamz@designwestarchitects.com

jwhitney@grandcountyutah.net

jwhitney@grandcountyutah.net

paul@acuteengineering.com

paul@acuteengineering.com

atmow@hotmail.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

emiller@farmington.utah.gov

emiller@farmington.utah.gov

Personal
User

IP Address Time

72.250.214.216 2015-01-15
10:28:28

50.79.65.217 2015-01-15
10:28:29

70.208.8.133 2015-01-15
10:50:42

8.22.12.80 2015-01-15
10:52:20

206.81.142.66 2015-01-15
11:07:01

206.81.142.66 2015-01-15
11:10:38

50.200.145.162 2015-01-15
11:14:35

174.239.101.73 2015-01-15
11:30:50

174.239.101.73 2015-01-15
11:34:20

66.29.161.82  2015-01-15
11:38:40

66.29.161.82  2015-01-15
11:39:51

65.122.116.92 2015-01-15
11:43:03

107.1.196.13  2015-01-15

12:52:18
107.1.196.13 2015-01-15

12:54:19
50.203.220.230 2015-01-15

13:10:30

50.203.220.230 2015-01-15
13:11:29

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 9

Title

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 1-Codes
Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Colorado (CO) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

Utah Code - State
Construction and Fire
Codes Act, Title 15A, july
20130

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASME Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASME Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

User

pbauer@laytoncity.org

drs@crsa-us.com

paul@acuteengineering.com

jeffh@rmstructural.com

cempey@reaveley.com

jfrazier@jub.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jeffh@rmstructural.com

jnewman@gshbsarchitects.com

mpompili@grandcountyutah.net

cnelson@herriman.org

cnelson@herriman.org

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

adamz@designwestarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

wca@wecaeng.com

wca@wcaeng.com

Personal
User

IP Address

8.22.12.33

23.30.54.241

66.29.161.82

24.10.153.244

67.214.232.174

66.193.41.72

107.1.196.13

24.10.153.244

107.1.196.13

184.12.16.228

50.204.19.86

50.204.19.86

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

50.200.145.162

107.1.196.13

75.148.97.217

75.148.97.217

Time
2015-01-15
13:41:16

2015-01-15
13:55:23

2015-01-15
14:16:02

2015-01-15
14:26:53

2015-01-15
15:36:05

2015-01-15
15:43:08

2015-01-15
17:04:29

2015-01-15
17:07:14

2015-01-15
17:12:42

2015-01-15
17:58:47

2015-01-15
18:17:01

2015-01-15
18:21:22

2015-01-15
18:24:36

2015-01-15
18:39:27

2015-01-15
18:43:53

2015-01-15
18:55:32

2015-01-15
19:05:00

2015-01-15
19:24:10

2015-01-15
19:27:16

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

40f 9

Title

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

State Construction Code
Administration and
Adoption of Approved State
Construction Code Rule,
R156-15A - Sept 20120

ASCE Free Publications
Package

Division of Facilities
Construction and
Management, Design
Requirements - June 11,
20090

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ICC 400-2012: Standard on
the Design and
Construction of Log
Structures 2012

ICC 600 - 2008: Standard
for Residential
Construction in High-Wind
Regions 2008

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

General Rules of the
Division of Occupational
and Professional Licensing,

User

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

hugger1951@hotmail.com

brada@tooelecity.org

dan@ckrengineers.com

dan@ckrengineers.com

dan@ckrengineers.com

kjensen@archnexus.com

ryan@rebstructuralengineers.com

jstuart@dristructural.com

jstuart@dristructural.com

todd.bischoff@flsmidth.com

don@4dengineers.com

chris@kimballeng.com

dpayne@vcbo.com

dpayne@vcbo.com

Personal
User

IP Address

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

70.210.192.21

76.76.252.30

173.8.94.105

173.8.94.105

173.8.94.105

209.23.209.98

67.177.41.106

73.52.143.146

73.52.143.146

75.169.211.214

67.172.226.5

173.165.142.70

206.81.142.66

206.81.142.66

Time

2015-01-15
19:39:35

2015-01-15
19:39:35

2015-01-16
00:08:41

2015-01-16
10:50:14

2015-01-16
12:44:49

2015-01-16
12:45:49

2015-01-16
12:48:19

2015-01-16
13:56:20

2015-01-16
17:33:02

2015-01-17
17:52:54

2015-01-17
17:59:36

2015-01-17
22:34:30

2015-01-19
16:59:21

2015-01-20
11:17:35

2015-01-20
11:49:20

2015-01-20
11:52:11

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 9

Title

R156-1 - March 11, 2013 0

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 1-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
1-Codes Package

ASCE Free Publications
Package

Public Safety Code - Utah
Fire Prevention and Safety
Act, July 20120

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 [-Codes
Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

User

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

rmcdonald@co.wasatch.ut.us

jerryt@nsicity.org
darrin.h@hydeparkcity.org
adamz@designwestarchitects.com
chris@kimballeng.com

maxfieldba@!dschurch.org

adamz@designwestarchitects.com

rdtregeagle@graniteschools.org

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

dhagerman@vcho.com

dallin.pedersen@bhbengineers.com

maxfieldba@Ildschurch.org

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

Personal
User

IP Address

67.214.232.174

67.214.232.174

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

67.214.232.174

168.178.202.3

199.127.127.58

50.73.34.222

50.200.145.162

173.165.142.70

216.49.181.252

50.200.145.162

205.127.88.58

107.1.196.13

67.214.232.174

107.1.196.13

206.81.142.66

74.95.54.181

71.199.42.219

63.234.77.129

Time

2015-01-20
18:34:57

2015-01-20
18:38:52

2015-01-20
18:45:10

2015-01-20
19:32:10

2015-01-21
11.08:23

2015-01-21
14:06:41

2015-01-21
17.40:42

2015-01-22
10:36:10

2015-01-22
12:24:39

2015-01-22
13:58:48

2015-01-22
14:04:30

2015-01-22
16:38:14

2015-01-22
17:38:17

2015-01-23
11:26:01

2015-01-23
12:24:13

2015-01-23
17:14:01

2015-01-23
17:39:53

2015-01-23
17:49:24

2015-01-24
09:19:45

2015-01-26
10:54:03

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

60f9

Title

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

R710. Public Safety, Fire
Marshal. R710-4. Buildings
Under the jurisdiction of
the State Fire Prevention
Board. 0

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASME Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASME Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

North Carolina (NC) State &
Local Jurisdiction
Amendments

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

User

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

Joshua@method-studio.com

Joshua@method-studio.com

Joshua@method-studio.com

Matt.rogers@usu.edu

john.chase@usu.edu

john.chase@usu.edu

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

dallin.pedersen@bhbengineers.com

bzahawi@stantec.com

jiohnson@reaveley.com

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

IP Address

63.234.77.129

23.30.58.253

23.30.58.253

23.30.58.253

144.39.194.38

129.123.68.130

129.123.68.130

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

67.214.232.174

74.95.54.181

207.34.120.71

67.214.232.174

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

Time

2015-01-26
11:04:53

2015-01-26
11:08:14

2015-01-26
11:13:12

2015-01-26
11:15:00

2015-01-26
14:59:47

2015-01-26
16:33:37

2015-01-26
16:39:04

2015-01-26
16:58:01

2015-01-26
17:12:34

2015-01-27
12:04:53

2015-01-27
17:08:03

2015-01-27
19:42:42

2015-01-28
09:29:59

2015-01-28
11:28:46

2015-01-28
11:31:26

2015-01-28
11:38:54

2015-01-28
11:39:51

2015-01-28
11:42:28

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

. Personal .
Title User User IP Address Time Status
Free Ipubs Package to Paid jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13  2015-01-28 Granted
Users 11:59:45
Free Ipubs Package to Paid jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13  2015-01-28 Granted
Users 12:06:40
ASCE Standards Referenced jjohnson@reaveley.com 67.214.232.174 2015-01-28 Granted
in 2012 I-Codes Package 17:24:59
NFPA Standards in 2012 01292015 50.78.68.222  2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:18:23
NFPA Standards in 2012 pbauer@laytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:21:26
NFPA Standards in 2012 pbauer@laytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:23:38
NFPA Standards in 2012 pbauer@Ilaytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:26:25
NFPA Standards in 2012 pbauer@laytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:28:03
Utah State Fire Code State  tsorensen@slco.org 198.50.4.4 2015-01-29 Granted
Construction and Fire Code 13:28:23
Act0
Maryland (MD) State & 01292015 50.78.68.222  2015-01-29 Granted
Local Jurisdiction 13:31:36
Amendments
Utah (UT) State & Local pbauer®@laytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
Jurisdiction Amendments 13:36:24
NFPA Standards in 2012 pbauer@laytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:38:10
State Construction and Fire kmott@duchesne.utah.gov 67.213.226.242 2015-01-29 Granted
Codes Act, Title 15A 13:39:26
Chapters 1 through 5 - July
1,20120
NFPA Standards in 2012 pbauer@laytoncity.org 8.22.12.33 2015-01-29 Granted
I-Codes Package 13:41:33
ICC A117.1 Accessible and  maxfieldba@ldschurch.org 216.49.181.252 2015-01-29 Granted
Usable Buildings and 13:42:14
Facilities 2009
Free Ipubs Package to Paid kmott@duchesne.utah.gov 67.213.226.242 2015-01-29 Granted
Users 13:43:41
ICC 300-2012: Bleachers, kmott@duchesne.utah.gov 67.213.226.242 2015-01-29 Granted
Folding and Telescopic 13:44:48
Seating, and Grandstands
2012
ICC 400-2012: Standard on  kmott@duchesne.utah.gov 67.213.226.242 2015-01-29 Granted
the Design and 13:45:21

Construction of Log
Structures 2012

of 9 3/17/2015 10:17 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

8 of 9

Title

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Arizona (AZ) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

General Rules of the
Division of Occupational
and Professional Licensing,
R156-1 - March 11,2013 0

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

FEMA Standards Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ICC 400-2012: Standard on
the Design and
Construction of Log

Personal

User User

dan@ckrengineers.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

jlyeoman@orem.org

pkashton@orem.org

chris@kimballeng.com

chris@kimballeng.com

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

cnelson@herriman.org

cnelson@herriman.org

kurtm@cmautah.com

stevenp@arwengineers.com

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

wca@wcaeng.com

wca@wcaeng.com

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

IP Address

173.8.94.105

50.79.65.217

50.79.65.217

50.79.65.217

8.22.15.4

8.22.15.4

173.165.142.70

173.165.142.70

65.130.4.170

50.204.19.86

50.204.19.86

50.79.65.217

50.73.45.57

65.130.4.170

65.130.4.170

75.148.97.217

75.148.97.217

65.130.4.170

65.130.4.170

Time
2015-01-29
13:49:54

2015-01-29
14:08:03

2015-01-29
14:08:36

2015-01-29
14:09:19

2015-01-29
14:27:30

2015-01-29
14:27:45

2015-01-29
15:41:23

2015-01-29
15:43:56

2015-01-29
16:40:29

2015-01-29
16:59:42

2015-01-29
17:01:18

2015-01-29
17:33:39

2015-01-29
17:35:32

2015-01-29
17:56:34

2015-01-29
17:57:21

2015-01-29
17:58:04

2015-01-29
17:58:58

2015-01-29
18:01:36

2015-01-29
18:03:23

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 9

Title

Structures 2012

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

General Rules of the
Division of Occupational
and Professional Licensing,
R156-1 - March 11, 2013 0

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ICC 300-2012: Bleachers,
Folding and Telescopic
Seating, and Grandstands
2012

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

User

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

maxfieldba@ldschurch.org

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

mmartin@eftarch.com

mmartin@eftarch.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

winp@whw-engineering.com

drs@crsa-us.com

kjensen@archnexus.com

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-01&filter=...

Personal
User

IP Address

65.130.4.170

71.199.42.219

72.250.214.216

72.250.214.216

70.103.196.78

70.103.196.78

50.79.65.217

50.79.65.217

50.73.41.177

23.30.54.241

209.23.209.98

Time

2015-01-29
18:04:46

2015-01-29
21:36:18

2015-01-30
09:03:02

2015-01-30
09:04:16

2015-01-30
13:31:32

2015-01-30
13:46:58

2015-01-30
14:18:28

2015-01-30
14:19:16

2015-01-30
15:04:04

2015-01-30
16:44:03

2015-01-30
17:11:08

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:17 AM



VMADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 2

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?usage&month=2015-02

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207

Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Monthly Package Usage, February 2015
Title

NFPA Standards in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASHRAE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package
ASCE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package
Free Ipubs Package to Paid Users

ASTM Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package
ASME Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package
Utah (UT) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments
Oklahoma (OK) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments
California {CA) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments
FEMA Standards Package

Ohio (OH) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments
Washington (WA) State & Local jurisdiction Amendments

Total:

Monthly Book Usage, February 2015

Title

ICC A117.1 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities 2009

ICC 300-2012: Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating, and Grandstands 2012

ICC 600 - 2008: Standard for Residential Construction in High-Wind Regions 2008
State Construction and Fire Codes Act, Title 15A Chapters 1 through 5 - July 1,20120
Utah Code - State Construction and Fire Cades Act, Title 15A, july 2013 0

R710. Public Safety, Fire Marshal. R710-4. Buildings Under the jurisdiction of the State Fire
Prevention Board. 0

Total:

Granted
25

13

18

5

6

14

91

Granted
12

2

1

22

Download as CSV

Exceeded

@ O O O O OO O O O o o o o

Download as C5V

Exceeded

o O o o o o©

3/17/2015 10:16 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?usage&month=2015-02

Title Granted  Exceeded
State Construction Code Administration and Adoption of Approved State Construction Code 1 0

Rule, R156-15A - Sept 2012 0

E814-13 Standard Test Method for Fire Tests of Penetration Firestop Systems 2013 1 0

Total: 22 0

20f2 3/17/2015 10:16 AM



VADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&filter=...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207
Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Package Accesses, February 2015 Download 25 G5V
Title User ;(:;sronal IP Address Time Status
Utah (UT) State & Local hugger1951@hotmail.com 70.209.197.55  2015-02-01 Granted
lurisdiction Amendments 23:59:57

ASHRAE Standards gcarlile@washingtoncity.org 208.117.120.10 2015-02-02 Granted
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 10:17:32

Package

ASHRAE Standards gcarlile@washingtoncity.org 208.117.120.10 2015-02-02 Granted
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 10:50:22

Package

ASTM Standards Referenced maxfieldba@ldschurch.org 216.49.181.251 2015-02-02 Granted
in 2012 I-Codes Package 12:23:23

ASHRAE Standards jvanausdal@springville.org 205.118.220.66 2015-02-02 Granted
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 15:15:09

Package

NFPA Standards in 2012 adamz@designwestarchitects.com 50.200.145.162 2015-02-02 Granted
I-Codes Package 15:35:07

State Construction and Fire jvanausdal@springville.org 205.118.220.66 2015-02-02 Granted
Codes Act, Title 15A 15:59:29

Chapters 1 through 5 - July

1,20120

NFPA Standards in 2012 bursenbach@slco.org 198.50.4.4 2015-02-02 Granted
I-Codes Package 17:44:21

ASHRAE Standards bursenbach@slco.org 198.50.4.4 2015-02-02 Granted
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 17:49:41

Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid  drs@crsa-us.com 23.30.54.241 2015-02-02 Granted
Users 19:24:00

ASCE Standards Referenced jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13 2015-02-03 Granted
in 2012 I-Codes Package 15:14:25

ASCE Standards Referenced jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13 2015-02-03  Granted
in 2012 I-Codes Package 15:31:36

of 7 3/17/2015 10:14 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

20of7

Title

ASTM Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

FEMA Standards Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

FEMA Standards Package

California (CA) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and

Facilities 2009

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and

Facilities 2009

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package

Washington (WA) State &

Local Jurisdiction
Amendments

ICC 600 - 2008: Standard for
Residential Construction in
High-Wind Regions 2008

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and

Facilities 2009

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and

Facilities 2009

NFPA Standards in 2012

I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012

I-Codes Package

User

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

maxfieldba@ldschurch.org

maxfieldba@ldschurch.org

evepchristensen@gmail.com

maxfieldba@ldschurch.org

maxfieldba@ldschurch.org

maxfieldba@ldschurch.org

evepchristensen@gmail.com

rdtregeagle@graniteschools.org

ccoleman@vernalcity.org

dan@ckrengineers.com

jshaffer@vernalcity.org

jshaffer@vernalcity.org

jshaffer@vernalcity.org

jbowser@edaarch.com

jbowser@edaarch.com

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

Personal
User

IP Address

107.1.196.13

216.49.181.251

216.49.181.251

155.97.237.154

216.49.181.251

216.49.181.251

216.49.181.251

155.97.237.154

205.127.88.58

199.117.60.25

173.8.94.105

67.213.229.61

67.213.229.61

67.213.229.61

69.27.20.131

69.27.20.131

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

Time
2015-02-03
16:00:53

2015-02-03
16:02:31

2015-02-03
16:03:51

2015-02-03
16:05:00

2015-02-03
16:05:18

2015-02-03
16:25:44

2015-02-03
16:26:19

2015-02-03
16:44:21

2015-02-03
17.07:57

2015-02-04
11:04:56

2015-02-04
13:11:34

2015-02-05
09:57:16

2015-02-05
10:03:05

2015-02-05
10:11:46

2015-02-05
11:08:54

2015-02-05
12:06:12

2015-02-05
15:45:55

2015-02-05
16:14:04

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02& filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:14 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 7

Title

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

Ohio (OH) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

1CC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASTM Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

R710. Public Safety, Fire
Marshal. R710-4. Buildings
Under the Jurisdiction of the
State Fire Prevention Board.
0

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

User

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jshaffer@vernalcity.org

jshaffer@vernalcity.org

jbowser@edaarch.com

jbowser@edaarch.com

jbowser@edaarch.com

emiller@farmington.utah.gov

emiller@farmington.utah.gov

john.chase@usu.edu

drs@crsa-us.com

drs@crsa-us.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

epehrson@royutah.org

epehrson@royutah.org

emiller@farmington.utah.gov

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

bldins@kane.utah.gov

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02& filter=...

Personal

IP Address
User

107.1.196.13

199.117.60.25

199.117.60.25

69.27.20.131

69.27.20.131

69.27.20.131

50.203.220.230

50.203.220.230

129.123.68.239

23.30.54.241

23.30.54.241

73.52.178.190

73.52.178.190

50.200.113.254

50.200.113.254

50.203.220.230

172.56.38.79

208.93.180.43

71.219.140.24

Time

2015-02-05
16:17:48

2015-02-05
16:38:35

2015-02-05
16:43:14

2015-02-05
17:38:01

2015-02-05
19:46:01

2015-02-05
19:47:55

2015-02-06
10:50:57

2015-02-06
10:52:06

2015-02-06
16:54:35

2015-02-06
17:32:01

2015-02-06
17:38:04

2015-02-07
14:51:50

2015-02-07
21:50:20

2015-02-09
16:28:12

2015-02-09
16:43:41

2015-02-09
17:15:10

2015-02-10
23:26:44

2015-02-11
11:28:19

2015-02-11
12:29:42

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:14 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

40f7

Title

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

Free Ipubs Package to Paid
Users

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ICC 300-2012: Bleachers,
Folding and Telescopic
Seating, and Grandstands
2012

Utah Code - State
Construction and Fire Codes
Act, Title 15A, July 2013 0

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

User

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

cnelson@herriman.org

cnelson@herriman.org

cnelson@herriman.org

cnelson@herriman.org

winp@whw-engineering.com

adamz@designwestarchitects.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

chris@kimballeng.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

IP Address

70.208.11.221

70.208.11.221

70.208.11.221

50.204.19.86

50.204.19.86

50.204.19.86

50.204.19.86

50.73.41.177

50.200.145.162

50.79.65.217

173.165.142.70

107.1.196.13

67.214.232.174

24.2.82.168

67.214.232.174

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

Time
2015-02-11
14:30:14

2015-02-11
15:23:56

2015-02-11
15:29:05

2015-02-11
18:14:24

2015-02-11
18:25:19

2015-02-11
18:27:51

2015-02-11
18:38:26

2015-02-12
12:54:55

2015-02-12
18:06:42

2015-02-13
12:44:29

2015-02-13
13:43:12

2015-02-13
17:27:22

2015-02-14
13:04:54

2015-02-14
14:53:48

2015-02-16
20:12:49

2015-02-18
12:47:19

2015-02-18
13:59:22

2015-02-18
13:59:22

2015-02-18
15:32:22

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:14 AM



AADCAD .com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 7

Title

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 [-Codes Package

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

Utah Code - State
Construction and Fire Codes
Act, Title 15A, July 20130

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 [-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
[-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
[-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

User

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

ccoleman@vernalcity.org

ccoleman@vernalcity.org

dpcoupe@graniteschools.org

dpcoupe@graniteschools.org

dpcoupe@graniteschools.org

tsorensen@slco.org

tsorensen@slco.org

tsorensen@slco.org

jjohnson@reaveley.com

maxfieldba®@ldschurch.org

ASTM Standards Referenced jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Oklahoma (OK) State &
Local Jurisdiction
Amendments

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jjurisdiction Amendments

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

State Construction Code
Administration and
Adoption of Approved State
Construction Code Rule,

pbauer@Ilaytoncity.org

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com
Sherniche@co.weber.ut.us

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&filter=...

Personal

IP Address
User

107.1.196.13

67.214.232.174

192.168.102.138
192.168.102.138
205.127.88.58
205.127.88.58
205.127.88.58

198.50.4.4
198.50.4.4
198.50.4.4
67.214.232.174
71.199.42.219
107.1.196.13
8.22.12.33

63.224.122.76

63.224.122.76
63.234.77.129

63.234.77.129

Time

2015-02-18
16:51:40

2015-02-18
17:52:19

2015-02-19
11:20:31

2015-02-19
11:25:02

2015-02-19
12:57:40

2015-02-19
13:02:32

2015-02-19
13:19:40

2015-02-20
10:13:04

2015-02-20
10:33:15

2015-02-20
10:38:28

2015-02-20
17:03:57

2015-02-21
08:49:27

2015-02-22
18:15:49

2015-02-23
17:50:32

2015-02-24
10:39:51

2015-02-24
10:41:39

2015-02-24
12:13:15

2015-02-24
12:36:01

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:14 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

60f7

Title

R156-15A - Sept 2012 0

ASCE Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASHRAE Standards
Referenced in 2012 I-Codes
Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

E814-13 Standard Test
Method for Fire Tests of
Penetration Firestop
Systems 2013

ASTM Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

Utah Code - State
Construction and Fire Codes
Act, Title 15A, July 2013 0

Utah (UT) State & Local
Jurisdiction Amendments

User

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

john.chase@usu.edu

john.chase@usu.edu

john.chase@usu.edu

john.chase@usu.edu

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

kurtm@cmautah.com

bursenbach@slco.org

bursenbach@slico.org

bursenbach@sico.org

Sberniche@co.weber.ut.us

john.chase@usu.edu

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

ptidwell@saratoga-springs.net

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02& filter=...

Personal
User

IP Address

63.234.77.129

63.234.77.129

63.234.77.129

129.123.68.239

129.123.68.239

129.123.68.239

129.123.68.239

63.234.77.129

63.234.77.129

50.79.65.217

198.50.4.4

198.50.4.4

198.50.4.4

63.234.77.129

129.123.68.239

70.196.192.1

70.196.192.1

70.196.192.1

70.196.192.1

Time

2015-02-24
12:45:43

2015-02-24
12:47:57

2015-02-24
13:29:55

2015-02-25
15:44:56

2015-02-25
15:48:06

2015-02-25
15:55:16

2015-02-25
15:56:02

2015-02-25
18:44:08

2015-02-25
18:52:03

2015-02-25
19:53:55

2015-02-26
12:45:33

2015-02-26
13:24:33

2015-02-26
13:24:56

2015-02-26
14:52:48

2015-02-26
15:59:40

2015-02-26
16:17:58

2015-02-26
16:19:29

2015-02-26
16:36:44

2015-02-26
16:36:50

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:14 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 7

Title

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 1-Codes Package

ICC 300-2012: Bleachers,
Folding and Telescopic
Seating, and Grandstands
2012

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASME Standards Referenced
in 2012 I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

User

john.chase@usu.edu

tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org

tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org

john.chase@usu.edu

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

kurtm@cmautah.com

Personal
User

IP Address

129.123.68.239

8.22.12.80

8.22.12.80

129.123.68.239

107.1.196.13

107.1.196.13

50.79.65.217

50.79.65.217

Time
2015-02-26
17:28:01

2015-02-26
17:34:23

2015-02-26
17:38:52

2015-02-26
18:18:26

2015-02-27
13:03:36

2015-02-27
13:59:17

2015-02-27
16:42:53

2015-02-27
16:55:21

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&filter=...

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:14 AM



VMAADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&id=95...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207
Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or
package.

Accesses for ICC A117.1 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities 2009,

February 2015 Dounload 25 3V
User Personal User IP Address Time Status
ccoleman@vernalcity.org 199.117.60.25 2015-02-04 11:04:56 Granted
dan@ckrengineers.com 173.8.94.105 2015-02-04 13:11:34 Granted
jbowser@edaarch.com 69.27.20.131 2015-02-05 11:08:54 Granted
jbowser@edaarch.com 69.27.20.131 2015-02-05 12:06:12 Granted
jbowser@edaarch.com 69.27.20.131 2015-02-05 17:38:01 Granted
jbowser@edaarch.com 69.27.20.131 2015-02-05 19:47:55 Granted
ccoleman@vernalcity.org 192.168.102.138 2015-02-19 11:20:31 Granted
ccoleman@vernalcity.org 192.168.102.138 2015-02-19 11:25:02 Granted
dpcoupe@graniteschools.org 205.127.88.58 2015-02-19 13:02:32 Granted
dpcoupe@graniteschools.org 205.127.88.58 2015-02-1913:19:40 Granted
kurtm@cmautah.com 50.79.65.217 2015-02-25 19:53:55 Granted
tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-02-26 17:38:52 Granted

of 1 3/17/2015 10:15 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&id=95...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207
Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Accesses for ICC 300-2012: Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating, and
Grandstands 2012, February 2015

Downioad as CSV

User Personal User IP Address Time Status
chris@kimballeng.com 173.165.142.70 2015-02-13 13:43:12 Granted
tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-02-26 17:34:23 Granted

of 1 3/17/2015 10:16 AM



MIADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-02&id=95...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207

Grant: A successful access to a resource.
Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Accesses for ICC 600 - 2008: Standard for Residential Construction in High-Wind
Regions 2008, February 2015 Doupload a2 G
User Personal User IP Address Time Status

jshaffer@vernalcity.org 67.213.229.61 2015-02-0510:11:46 Granted

of 1 3/17/201510:16 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?usage&month=2015-03

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage = Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207
Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Monthly Package Usage, March 2015 Dounload as (5
Title Granted Exceeded
NFPA Standards in 2012 I-Codes Package 11 0

ASHRAE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package 5 0

ASCE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package 3 0

Free Ipubs Package to Paid Users 4 0

ASTM Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package 4 0

Colorado (CO) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 1 0

Missouri (MO) State & Local Jurisdiction Amendments 1 0

Total: 29 0
Monthly Book Usage, March 2015 Donnload s Y
Title Granted Exceeded
ICC A117.1 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities 2009 1 0

Utah Code - State Construction and Fire Codes Act, Title 15A, July 2013 0 1 0

Utah State Fire Code State Construction and Fire Code Act 0 2 0

Division of Facilities Construction and Management, Design Requirements - June 11,20090 1 0

Total: 5 0

of 1 3/17/2015 10:22 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-03&filter=...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207
Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or
package.

Download as CsV

Package Accesses, March 2015

Title User Personal IP Address Time Status
User

Free Ipubs Package to Paid adamz@designwestarchitects.com 50.200.145.162 2015-03-02  Granted

Users 11:58:00

Free Ipubs Package to Paid adamz@designwestarchitects.com 50.200.145.162 2015-03-02  Granted

Users 12:13:37

Free Ipubs Package to Paid adamz@designwestarchitects.com 50.200.145.162 2015-03-02  Granted

Users 13:17:54

NFPA Standards in 2012 jshaffer@vernaicity.org 199.117.60.25  2015-03-02 Granted

I-Codes Package 13:19:34

NFPA Standards in 2012 tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-03-02  Granted

I-Codes Package 17:10:17

NFPA Standards in 2012 tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-03-02  Granted

I-Codes Package 17:36:31

ASHRAE Standards jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13 2015-03-02  Granted

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 18:07:40

Package

Utah State Fire Code State  sadams@pcfd.org 67.128.135.133 2015-03-03  Granted

Construction and Fire Code 18:55:13

Act 0

ASTM Standards sadams@pcfd.org 67.128.135.133  2015-03-03  Granted

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 18:56:59

Package

NFPA Standards in 2012 tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22,12.80 2015-03-03  Granted

I-Codes Package 18:58:24

Colorado (CO) State & Local sadams@pcfd.org 67.128.135.133 2015-03-03 Granted

Jurisdiction Amendments 18:59:03

Missouri (MO) State & Local jnewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13 2015-03-03 Granted

Jurisdiction Amendments 21:21:17

Utah State Fire Code State  rskoger@gmail.com 66.60.112.50 2015-03-04 Granted

Construction and Fire Code 10:43:00

Act 0

of 3 3/17/2015 10:11 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

20f3

Title

ASHRAE Standards

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced

in 2012 I-Codes Package

ASCE Standards Referenced

in 2012 I-Codes Package

ICC A117.1 Accessible and
Usable Buildings and
Facilities 2009

ASTM Standards

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package

ASCE Standards Referenced

in 2012 I-Codes Package

Utah Code - State
Construction and Fire
Codes Act, Title 15A, July
20130

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

Free Ipubs Package to Paid

Users

ASTM Standards

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package
ASHRAE Standards

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package
ASHRAE Standards

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

NFPA Standards in 2012
I-Codes Package

ASHRAE Standards

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes

Package

User

rskoger@gmail.com

cmaedgen@dsdmail.net

cmaedgen@dsdmail.net

jiohnson@reaveley.com

jjohnson@reaveley.com

ptomasino@utah.gov

gwillie@morgan-county.net

bhulse@grandcountyutah.net

Matt.rogers@usu.edu

Matt.rogers@usu.edu

scott@spe-architect.com

maxfieldba@Idschurch.org

impaidtoplay@hotmail.com

bursenbach@slco.org

jerryt@nslcity.org

jerryt@nslcity.org

jerryt@nslcity.org

mmartin@eftarch.com

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-03&filter=...

Personal
User

IP Address

66.60.112.50

163.6.13.74

163.6.13.74

67.214.232.174

67.214.232.174

168.179.245.111

72.250.211.243

174.239.97.189

129.123.68.158

129.123.68.158

63.230.14.133

216.49.181.251

172.56.39.222

198.50.4.4

199.127.127.58

199.127.127.58

199.127.127.58

70.103.196.78

Time

2015-03-04
10:46:20

2015-03-04
11:19:27

2015-03-04
11:55:44

2015-03-05
09:04:59

2015-03-05
09:14:12

2015-03-05
11:21:51

2015-03-05
17:19:04

2015-03-05
18:54:05

2015-03-09
11:47:05

2015-03-09
11:48:44

2015-03-10
11:55:55

2015-03-10
12:48:42

2015-03-10
13:28:23

2015-03-10
14:39:16

2015-03-10
17:52:52

2015-03-10
18:03:25

2015-03-10
18:06:28

2015-03-11
11:26:52

Status

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

Granted

3/17/2015 10:11 AM



AADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-03&filter=...

Title User Personal IP Address Time Status
User

NFPA Standards in 2012 stevet@cartwright-aec.com 65.115.218.238 2015-03-12 Granted

I-Codes Package 13:47:54

ASTM Standards jlyeoman@orem.org 8.22.15.4 2015-03-12  Granted

Referenced in 2012 I-Codes 15:40:37

Package

Division of Facilities ccoleman@vernalcity.org 199.117.60.25  2015-03-17 Granted

Construction and 09:53:53

Management, Design
Requirements - June 11,
20090

of 3 3/17/2015 10:11 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat& month=2015-03&id=95...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207
Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Accesses for NFPA Standards in 2012 I-Codes Package, March 2015 Dounloadas G
User Personal User IP Address Time Status
jshaffer®@vernalcity.org 199.117.60.25 2015-03-02 13:19:34 Granted
tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-03-02 17:10:17 Granted
tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-03-02 17:36:31 Granted
tpeterson@boxeldercounty.org 8.22.12.80 2015-03-03 18:58:24 Granted
cmaedgen@dsdmail.net 163.6.13.74 2015-03-04 11:19:27 Granted
cmaedgen@dsdmail.net 163.6.13.74 2015-03-04 11:55:44 Granted
Matt.rogers@usu.edu 129.123.68.158 2015-03-09 11:48:44 Granted
jerryt@nsicity.org 199.127.127.58 2015-03-10 17:52:52 Granted
jerryt@nsicity.org 199.127.127.58  2015-03-10 18:03:25 Granted
jerryt@nsicity.org 199.127.127.58 2015-03-10 18:06:28 Granted
stevet@cartwright-aec.com 65.115.218.238 2015-03-12 13:47:54 Granted

of 1 3/17/2015 10:05 AM



MADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 1

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users

My Transactions

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-03&id=95...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

Account Usage Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207

Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Accesses for ASCE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package, March 2015

User Personal User
jichnson@reaveley.com
jjohnson@reaveley.com

bhulse@grandcountyutah.net

67.214.232.174
67.214.232.174
174.239.97.189

Download as CSV

Time Status

2015-03-05 09:04:59 Granted
2015-03-05 09:14:12 Granted
2015-03-05 18:54:05 Granted

3/17/2015 10:08 AM



VIADCAD.com - The Cloud-Based Reference Library

of 1

http://www.madcad.com/my_account/?stat&month=2015-03&id=95...

Welcome Thomas Peterson @ State of Utah Code Officials!

My Subscriptions My Profile My Users My Transactions Account Usage

Resource Usage

Below are the monthly usage stats of your MADCAD.com Packages & Books. If you need any older
usage data, please contact support at support@madcad.com or call 1.800.798.9296 ext.207

Grant: A successful access to a resource.

Exceed: When a user is denied access to a book due to concurrency limitation on the book or

package.

Accesses for ASHRAE Standards Referenced in 2012 I-Codes Package, March 2015

User Personal User IP Address
jrewman@gsbsarchitects.com 107.1.196.13
rskoger@gmail.com 66.60.112.50
impaidtoplay@hotmail.com 172.56.39.222
bursenbach@slco.org 198.50.4.4
mmartin@eftarch.com 70.103.196.78

Time

2015-03-02 18:07:40
2015-03-04 10:46:20
2015-03-10 13:28:23
2015-03-10 14:39:16
2015-03-11 11:26:52

Download as CSV
Status
Granted
Granted
Granted
Granted
Granted

3/17/2015 10:07 AM

















